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When staff members for Kentucky Archaeological Survey found out the University of Kentucky was
cutting the program in March, they thought their jobs were lost.

However, Western Kentucky University announced Thursday that it will provide KAS with a new
home where the agency can serve the state, according to a WKU press release.

KAS tries to protect archaeological sites by working with teachers, students, landowners,
communities and government agencies, WKU said. KAS also educates the public about Kentucky's
archaeological background.

A few of KSA's partners include The Capitol City Museum, Shelby County Historical Society and
other nonprofit organizations, according to WKU. KAS also works with the Kentucky Heritage
Council and has previously opened up archaeological digs to younger students.

KAS was recognized nationally for its Davis Bottom History Preservation project in a historically
black neighborhood in Lexington.

https://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/pcs/click?xai=AKAOjsu9IpWQekKX1qqLeov_BNd-vunnElgBuZyvk8Fprsk0MJ31pyY95HM1sca_wDH6Qh4s88E48jqfUfp_glkWQxLj3lwUeYPe2W0CrahTb9e0YvCRHBUJRctNCndmmMPhr9OjiNrbUXEOPejtKWpfaU1LgzV8yUSYAYkQYZHySUNUKq0Le0lG1WCzf2lzgjA9a0716_SIWQzBKpgJCJ8Kr_aV-BYoVDvFJE7c_vVhedcX4p8oPg1kpOCTKFa1445DH5vfxpt2bOG1io1grQr6&sai=AMfl-YSNryONX-qlVegfWYKAtdawdIBpiKc1aG3UVMULffceCoxCjBoInfixHKoEeGzeTlA6wTvzX6fAmIm8qmosFeD5Osx1mFIx26TcoOvK&sig=Cg0ArKJSzIbyyDs8xxsz&adurl=https://fridayafter5.com/%3Futm_source%3Dpmg%26utm_medium%3Dbanner%26utm_campaign%3Dmessengerinquirer&nx=CLICK_X&ny=CLICK_Y
http://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/pcs/click?xai=AKAOjsuCkLSLBc7FmTexL8C8EjHmB7cHFumqQoAyYzAw6Esj-OS8srsFxjVLYLcYLQEdu33-Tm-s3Z_dM870rmJop4Rh-_olB-ApVKAeLOCUwkZEQRoD-dM4QsxnLUt4pVcNsmkoc_xoJ5fMxP9JfimW34eiUogEbrNe08QJ3IWH7_WrdREl6qakfVeuN9hzA3bWdK9TiUb5jzp5akJKN5cdVFfSC2bR_zOhFRr43PkmM_Egl8tK4Ll93ao72Y6y_DApjlO-44uAQCWQevArr7Xi&sai=AMfl-YSU9MJw3RspMAjVSCRAzcM4vM-b5ZZfKTyM_T_wZtKzGlXwTh2Vd9pqXDXRZ2Zyo99QCb8bo0Xw1A5pJx49RF8_sWgXuxxVwavq6ujJ&sig=Cg0ArKJSzKFCNAxTs7qY&adurl=http://www.owensborohealth.org/lift%3Futm_source%3Dpmg%26utm_medium%3Dbanner%26utm_campaign%3Dmessengerinquirer


KSA began in 1995 and is self-funded, according to WKU. Staff salaries, student assistants and
educational products will be supported by state and federal funding, agreements with nonprofit
organizations, fee-for-service contracts and private contributions.

The 10-year partnership with WKU started June 1, WKU said. The move will occur over the
summer, said WKU spokesman Bob Skipper.

Eric Schlarb, a KAS staff archaeologist since 1997, said in a release he was shocked when UK
decided it would no longer host the agency. However, he said he was reassured with the WKU deal.

"The opportunity to come to Western really makes a huge difference," Schlarb said in the release.
"It enables us to continue to do the work we've been building the last twenty years."

Darlene Applegate, archaeologist and head of WKU's Department of Folk Studies and
Anthropology, said in a news release that she was excited about the opportunities KAS provides for
the university.

Applegate said WKU can possibly raise its profile and recruit more students in the program
because of the new offerings. She said she anticipates WKU becoming a focal point for public
archaeology in Kentucky.

The KAS lab will be located in Cherry Hall on the WKU campus but the lab's work will primarily be
done off campus at project or outreach sites, WKU said. KSA was originally housed in the UK
College of Arts and Sciences in Lexington.

When UK first announced it would be cutting KAS, it said the resources previously designated for
KAS would be used to add two new faculty members to the archaeology department. KAS
employees and members of the archaeology community expressed their shock and disapproval
with the cuts. Some UK anthropology alumni wrote a letter to the Herald-Leader opposing the
decision.
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