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Abstract
Early entrance to college, a form of academic acceleration, is an educational alternative 
that opens pathways for advanced students to have challenging, stimulating, and 
relevant learning experiences. Children who choose this option enter the adult 
world several years earlier than most of their age peers. This involves extra growth, 
adaptation, and a nontypical route through adolescent developmental milestones. 
These changes may be a great challenge for children and their families. In this study, 
we report findings from semi-structured interviews with 36 parents whose children 
participated in one of two different early entrance to college programs at the 
University of Washington. We explored reasons and motivations behind families’ 
decisions for early entrance to college, their expectations, concerns, and overall 
experiences during the transition period and beyond.
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Families looking for educational environments to challenge their children may face a 
decision on whether to accelerate them academically by sending them to college early. 
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Academic acceleration is defined as, “matching the level and complexity of the cur-
riculum with the readiness and motivation of the student” (Colangelo et al., 2004, p. 1; 
National Association for Gifted Children [NAGC], n.d.), and it can range from sub-
ject-acceleration and grade-level acceleration to more radical forms of acceleration 
such as early entrance to college (missing 2–3 years of high school). In fact, the 
Acceleration Institute (n.d.-a) defines up to 20 different types of academic accelera-
tion. In this study, and for the purposes of this article, the term acceleration refers to 
early entrance to college.

Although academic acceleration has been an advocated, research-supported prac-
tice for decades, concerns linger when families find themselves trying to decide if 
radical acceleration, such as early entrance to college, is best for their children. 
Research pertaining to academic acceleration typically addresses the benefits of accel-
eration (Brody et al., 2004; Steenbergen-Hu & Moon, 2011), academic and lifelong 
outcomes (Boazman & Sayler, 2011; NAGC, n.d.; Park et al., 2013; Wai et al., 2010), 
students’ satisfaction with their experiences (Lee et al., 2010), and concerns regarding 
students’ social-emotional needs (Brody et al., 2004; Hoogeveen et al., 2012; NAGC, 
n.d.). In essence, research pertaining to academic acceleration has focused on students’ 
experiences and outcomes (see Wai, 2015, for a brief review) as opposed to parents’ 
experiences. Studies related to parents of gifted students typically include topics such 
as parents’ influence, parents’ perceptions of highly capable children’s abilities, and 
parents’ satisfaction with advanced academic programming (Jolly & Matthews, 2012). 
Research regarding the challenges and overall experiences families face with educa-
tional experiences for their academically advanced children (Morawska & Sanders, 
2009), specifically those related to families’ decisions to enroll their children in pro-
grams of radical acceleration and their experiences during the decision and transition 
processes, are less studied or understood (Noble et al., 2008). Despite acceleration as 
a suggested best practice, parental concerns regarding acceleration practices, such as 
early entrance to college, are still abound (Boazman & Sayler, 2011; Colangelo et al., 
2004; Hoogeveen et al., 2012; Noble et al., 2008; Siegle et al., 2013; Steenbergen-Hu 
& Moon, 2011).

Previous studies have reported numerous positive outcomes of early entrance to 
college for students’ academic experiences and long-term careers (Hertzog & Chung, 
2015), yet little research has explored the perspectives and experiences of parents 
when their children transitioned to college early. However, “often, through their per-
sonal experience, students and parents can understand and appreciate the short-term 
benefits of acceleration” (Steenbergen-Hu & Moon, 2011, p. 50), and by extension, 
parents may begin to understand and appreciate the benefits of acceleration through 
the shared, lived experiences of other parents whose children have experienced radical 
acceleration.

Parents are often more knowledgeable regarding “appropriate educational options 
for gifted students than the school decision makers” (Vialle et al., 2001, p. 17), and 
find themselves advocating for educational opportunities beyond what is traditionally 
offered by school institutions (Morawska & Sanders, 2009; Robinson, 2004; 
Rubenstein et  al., 2015; Vialle et  al., 2001). However, parents still noted concerns 
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about acceleration that often revolved around the child’s social and emotional devel-
opment (Mammadov et al., 2018; Robinson, 2004; Southern & Jones, 2004; Vialle 
et  al., 2001). Brody and colleagues (2004) suggested concerns regarding academic 
acceleration are a result of researchers not making the case for successful outcomes 
“compelling” enough (p. 104).

In this study, we sought to learn from parents about their experiences and roles dur-
ing their children’s early transition to college. The following overarching research 
question guided this study:

Research Question 1 (RQ1): What are the experiences and perspectives of parents 
whose children have transitioned to college early?

We hope to contribute to the literature through these parents’ voices by illuminating 
their experiences, challenges, and the benefits they thought their children gained by 
going to college early. To help us understand the perspectives of parents, the literature 
review will highlight several themes: the role of parents in typical adolescent develop-
ment, parental relationships with children identified as gifted or advanced academi-
cally, concerns related to acceleration options, and existing research regarding early 
entrance to college.

Literature Review

Adolescents’ Development and Early Entrance to College

Adolescence may be a particularly difficult stage of development for many young 
people. It is a time when their decision-making function of their brain is still develop-
ing (U.S. Department of Health and Human Services, Office of Adolescent Health, 
2018). Entering college early (as young as 15 years) may affect not only the child but 
also the family, as parents must navigate the move toward their child’s independence 
earlier than developmentally (or typically) expected. In addition, college may bring 
early exposure to a range of experiences especially in social and emotional domains 
that the child otherwise might not face until their late teens. These experiences and 
changes may be a great challenge for children and their families.

Parental Roles in the Lives of Academically Advanced Children

Parents play an important role in the lives of their children. These family relationships 
have a key impact on the child’s achievement and talent development (Hébert et al., 
2009; Jolly & Matthews, 2012; Wu, 2008). For instance, Hébert and colleagues (2009) 
looked at 10 father–son relationships and identified six positive themes that influenced 
the son’s talent development. Fathers in these relationships unequivocally believed in 
their son’s abilities, had a strong work ethic, and maintained high expectations for 
their son while also cultivating determination. The fathers in this study also encour-
aged their sons and showed pride when their sons accomplished something. Finally, 
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both father and son demonstrated a mutual admiration and respect for one another 
(Hébert et al., 2009).

Sayler (2015) examined the impact of family support and relationships through the 
lens of parenting styles as a factor prior to and after their children enrolled in the Texas 
Academy of Mathematics and Science (TAMS)—an early entrance to college pro-
gram. He found that students’ grade point average (GPA) increased during their time 
in TAMS when they had parents who had an authoritative style of parenting (i.e., 
parents who are responsive and nurturing but also set rules and boundaries for their 
children); whereas TAMS students’ GPA decreased when they had parents who had an 
authoritarian (i.e., strict rules with very little or no explanation) or a permissive parent-
ing style (i.e., few limits/rules accompanied with greater emphasis on responsiveness). 
Sayler concluded that parents were important to students’ early entrance success as 
well as their increases in academic performance.

In another study, Wu (2008) interviewed five Chinese American parents of children 
enrolled in a gifted and talented program to explore their personal beliefs and practices 
in terms of their children’s talent development. These parents felt a responsibility for 
good parenting as well as high levels of confidence in their child’s future. More spe-
cifically, Wu found that a parent’s desire to be a good parent was related to the level of 
involvement by the parent and the expectations he or she had for the child. Moreover, 
these parents felt responsible for finding and securing opportunities for their children. 
Family relationships impacted children’s academic and talent achievement as well as 
their social-emotional development (Hébert et al., 2009; Wu, 2008).

Parental involvement: Supporting their child.  When asked to reflect on their experiences, 
children who have accelerated academically have reported that their parents’ advocacy 
and support have been critical to their success (Hertzog & Chung, 2015; Mammadov 
et al., 2018; Wells et al., 2009). These high achieving individuals reflected on their 
parents as providing them with support, while also giving them the room to develop 
their own “sense of direction” (Colangelo et  al., 2004, p. 80). In a two-part study, 
researchers interviewed 34 graduates from an early entrance to college program in 
China. When asked about their relationships with their parents, 30 graduates reported 
having a good relationship with their parents (Dai et al., 2015); and that their parents, 
though devoted to their education, gave them autonomy in their early years (Dai & 
Steenbergen-Hu, 2015). Most of the graduates interviewed also shared their exposure 
to acceleration experiences in their early years (i.e., primary and secondary school), 
some of whom had parents who “deliberately promoted” these early acceleration 
experiences (Dai & Steenbergen-Hu, 2015, p. 16). Similarly, in a two-phase study, 
researchers surveyed more than 150 alumni from an early entrance to college program 
and subsequently followed up by interviewing 26 of the alumni originally surveyed 
(Hertzog & Chung, 2015; Mammadov et al., 2018). Overall, findings from the two-
phase study reflected the decision to attend college early as a student-driven decision, 
but alumni also communicated the supportive role of their parents throughout the early 
entrance to college process. Although findings from these studies reflect the nature of 
parents’ roles as one that provides support while also granting autonomy to their 
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children; these findings reflect the child’s perspective of their parents’ roles rather than 
those of the parents.

Parent involvement can take multiple forms such as advocacy roles (Rubenstein 
et al., 2015; Vialle et al., 2001), expectations or influence (Jolly & Matthews, 2012), 
and social support (Morawska & Sanders, 2009). Parents’ educational involvement 
has been directly tied to their children’s academic achievement as well as their attitude 
and behavior toward school (Jolly & Matthews, 2012). In addition, parental support 
has been identified as an influential factor for a child’s successful transition to college 
early (Colangelo et al., 2004; Sayler, 2015).

Parents searching for appropriate education.  Researchers have suggested that parents of 
gifted children have experienced unique challenges, some of which were attributed to 
issues experienced in traditional academic settings (Jolly & Matthews, 2012; 
Morawska & Sanders, 2009). Similarities have also been found with parents of twice-
exceptional and gifted children, in that these parents expressed frustration pertaining 
to inadequate preparation of teachers and schools to provide an educational experience 
or environment that was appropriate for their child (Rubenstein et al., 2015; Young & 
Balli, 2014). As a result, parents experienced frustration when confronted with the 
realization that traditional academic settings were unable to meet the needs of their 
children. In addition, parents reported reaching beyond school personnel to search for 
information regarding resources and educational alternatives for their children (Ruben-
stein et al., 2015).

Many parents have considered early entrance to college as a result of their dissatis-
faction with their children’s current school experiences (Jolly & Matthews, 2012; 
Morawska & Sanders, 2009; Noble et al., 2008), or because their children were dis-
satisfied or bored at school (Mammadov et al., 2018; Sayler, 2015). Moreover, parents 
reported discontentment with school personnel’s lack of understanding related to the 
needs of their children and how to address those needs (Morawska & Sanders, 2009; 
Rubenstein et al., 2015).

The role of school personnel in academic acceleration.  School personnel play an impor-
tant role for families considering academic acceleration. Vialle et al. (2001) surveyed 
(n = 27) and interviewed (n = 10) school principals regarding early entrance to col-
lege; they found that 20 principals reported being aware of an acceleration policy yet 
were unfamiliar with the accompanying recommendations. Of the 20 principals sur-
veyed, four were found to be in opposition to the policy. Vialle and colleagues found 
that school principals often attributed a child’s non-enrollment in acceleration services 
to his or her immaturity and physical size and often commented that parents’ desires 
for their children were to fit in with peers and progress at a normal rate. Vialle et al. 
concluded that social and emotional concerns served as a key barrier for early entrance 
to college and suggested that more work ought to focus on professional development 
in the area of academic acceleration.

In another study, Siegle and colleagues (2013) surveyed 152 educators regarding 
their concerns and beliefs on acceleration. Based on their findings, they concluded that 
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educators generally did not have academic concerns pertaining to acceleration; how-
ever, educators reported mixed concerns when asked about social/emotional concerns. 
For instance, 33% of educators surveyed were unsure when asked about the emotional 
adjustment of accelerated students, and when asked if students would experience neg-
ative effects socially, approximately half of the educators reported no concern whereas 
the other half were either undecided or held concerns for certain social aspects. In 
addition, most of the educators reported being qualified to identify student candidates 
for acceleration, but more than half reported having more information on acceleration 
could benefit their practice. Finally, although teachers illustrated support of accelera-
tion practices, teachers believed other stakeholders would not, suggesting that poten-
tial barriers to acceleration could lie in the perceptions of others’ beliefs as opposed to 
their own (Siegle et al., 2013).

Researchers have also surveyed school counselors concluding that the majority of 
school counselors lacked formal training in gifted education yet were often utilized as 
consultants when considering educational options, such as acceleration for students 
(Wood et al., 2010). In their study, school counselors also reported feeling more com-
fortable recommending some acceleration practices (i.e., dual enrollment) over others 
(i.e., grade skipping). Finally, social/emotional factors were cited among key consider-
ations when making the decision to recommend (or not) a student for academic accel-
eration (Wood et al., 2010). Otherwise stated, students often were denied acceleration 
opportunities due to social and emotional concerns rather than academic concerns.

Decision-making factors.  Parents have reported wanting and needing more information 
regarding educational options for their academically advanced children (Morawska & 
Sanders, 2009), and for parents supporting their children’s decisions to enroll early in 
college, clear and accessible information on educational programs was critical to the 
decision-making process. For instance, Colangelo and colleagues (2004) emphasized 
the importance of providing parents with comprehensive, transparent information 
regarding acceleration and early entrance to college. In addition, it is important to 
ensure families have access to research-supported information (Colangelo et al., 2004; 
Siegle et al., 2013; Vialle et al., 2001; Wood et al., 2010), an area in which the field has 
made considerable progress (Acceleration Institute, n.d.-b; Assouline et  al., 2015; 
Davidson Institute, n.d.; NAGC, n.d.; Robinson Center for Young Scholars, n.d.). 
Making information and resources available to parents can benefit families trying to 
decide on the best acceleration option for their children.

The decision to enroll early in college is a big decision for children and their fami-
lies, and the inclusion and involvement of the child’s parents in the decision-making 
process is an advocated practice for those considering academic acceleration 
(Colangelo et al., 2004). Overall, individuals who accelerated academically reported a 
sense of autonomy in their decision to enroll early in college; however, the decision 
was not made without their parents’ input or consideration (Hertzog & Chung, 2015; 
Mammadov et al., 2018; Noble et al., 2008). In fact, families looked into early entrance 
to college in hopes that the college environment would provide a more academically 
challenging experience for their children (Hertzog & Chung, 2015; Mammadov et al., 
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2018). Families also considered early entrance to college due to the child’s unhappi-
ness with social networks in a traditional school setting (Noble et al., 2008) or unhap-
piness and boredom with current curriculum and pacing (Mammadov et  al., 2018; 
Sayler, 2015).

In 2008, Noble and colleagues surveyed 95 parents of children enrolled in early 
entrance programs to understand parents’ perspectives as they experienced the early 
entrance to college. They queried parents as to why they chose early entrance to col-
lege for their children, how satisfied parents were with early entrance programs, their 
perceived advantages and disadvantages of the early entrance process, and the per-
ceived impact early entrance programs had on their family relationships. Key findings 
from the study indicated that the primary reasons parents enrolled their children in 
college early were because their children wanted to enroll, were dissatisfied with the 
academic rigor in their previous schools, and their children were generally unhappy at 
their previous schools (Noble et al., 2008). Parents also shared their primary concerns 
considered social impacts due to their children’s young age upon college enrollment, 
potential difficulties related to career and life goals, and their children’s abilities to 
navigate the college system. In addition, Noble and colleagues (2008) reported that the 
early entrance process had impacted family norms such as changes in curfew and 
trouble dealing with their children’s increased autonomy and freedom. Parents also 
noted impacts on sibling relationships and mixed results regarding family and friends’ 
support of their decision to enroll their children in college early. Although parents 
voiced concerns and challenges experienced as a family; overall, 67% of parents were 
satisfied with the early entrance to college experience (Noble et al., 2008).

Lingering Concerns Regarding Academic Acceleration

Despite existing research supporting the benefits of academic acceleration, educational 
stakeholders, such as parents and educators, still hold reservations regarding accelera-
tion and even more so when considering more radical forms of acceleration, such as 
grade skipping and early entrance to college (Colangelo et al., 2004; Siegle et al., 2013; 
Vialle et al., 2001). Although concerns are often related to the social and emotional 
development of the child (Colangelo et al., 2004; Vialle et al., 2001), studies have sup-
ported social/emotional benefits for academically accelerated children (Rogers & 
Kimpston, 1992; Steenbergen-Hu et al., 2016; Steenbergen-Hu & Moon, 2011). For 
instance, Steenbergen-Hu and Moon (2011) found slightly positive effects on acceler-
ated children’s social/emotional development. Moreover, when comparing accelerated 
students to on-level students, Colangelo and colleagues (2010) found commensurate 
levels of social/emotional adjustment stating, “there is no evidence that acceleration has 
a negative effect on a student’s social-emotional development” (p. 181).

Regardless, concerns linger and can play a pivotal role in the decision to accelerate 
or not. For instance, in addition to emotional concerns, parents have noted social con-
cerns regarding their children being separated from their same-age peers 
(Steenbergen-Hu et al., 2016) as well as concerns their children would miss traditional 
school experiences such as high school prom and graduation (Noble et  al., 2008). 
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Research addressing social/emotional concerns related to academic acceleration has 
suggested that apprehension surrounding acceleration practices could be alleviated if 
more research-based information were accessible and training/professional develop-
ment opportunities were available (Colangelo et al., 2004; Siegle et al., 2013; Vialle 
et al., 2001; Wood et al., 2010).

Most of the existing research has focused on students’ experiences related to aca-
demic acceleration as well as factors related to their academic experiences (e.g., con-
cerns, benefits, parental support). However, it is important to note that research 
regarding parents’ concerns pertaining to academic acceleration is limited (Noble 
et al., 2008), when compared with the amount of research available on educational 
practitioners’ concerns (Siegle et  al., 2013; Vialle et  al., 2001; Wood et  al., 2010). 
Moreover, research pertaining to parents of gifted children has focused on parental 
roles as they pertain to students’ academic experience. What is missing from the 
research are studies that focus on parents’ perspectives and their overall experiences 
related to sending their children to college early.

Purpose

This study was designed to address an evident gap in the literature: parents’ perspec-
tives related to their children enrolling in college early. Taking a phenomenological 
approach, this study extends upon survey findings from Noble et al. (2008), to explore, 
through parent interviews, the experiences of parents whose children entered the uni-
versity through early entrance programs. Typically, in phenomenological studies, 
interviews are conducted with participants who have firsthand knowledge of their 
experience. Researchers sought to understand what a certain experience―early 
entrance to college―was like from parents’ points of view. The goal of this approach 
is to accurately describe the “phenomenon under study, not to generalize to theories or 
models” (Krefting, 1991, p. 91). Specifically, the goal of this study was to understand 
the early entrance to college experience as perceived by parents of current students. It 
was believed that a phenomenological approach would provide the greatest insight 
into these perceived experiences. More specifically, the researchers of this study were 
interested in learning about parents’ experiences during their children’s transition from 
the K-12 school system to college, how parents allowed (or agreed to the decision by) 
their children to choose the early entrance to college option, how this decision impacted 
their family life, and parents’ thoughts regarding the long-term impact of the program, 
including what they perceived as challenges and benefits.

Method

Context of Study

The Early Entrance Program (EEP) and the UW Academy are two different types of 
early entrance to college programs at the University of Washington.



Hertzog et al.	 9

The EEP Program is a two-stage program consisting of 1 year of intensive college 
preparatory classes taught on-sight in the Transition School, followed by full matricu-
lation the following year when they enter the EEP Program, usually at the age of 15 
years. This program has been in existence since 1977, and it facilitates early entry to 
the university for a selected cohort of approximately 16 highly advanced students that 
enter after seventh or eighth grade. Students who enter the Transition School skip all 
4 years of high school. Transition School is designed to bring their academic skills 
from a middle school level all the way to being ready for college in 1 year. The pro-
gram prepares them for the academic rigor as well as the quantity of work they may 
experience in their first year of college. Parents and their children are interviewed as 
part of the admissions process for this program.

The UW Academy Program offers academically advanced students the opportunity 
to enter the university as freshmen after their tenth grade year of high school. Each 
year, 35 to 40 students are selected for the cohort based on a holistic review of their 
college applications. At this writing, the UW Academy is 18 years old. Both early 
entrance programs are commuter programs, and most of these students live with their 
parents when they become freshman because they are too young to live in the dormi-
tories on campus. Other research has shed light into how they experience college life 
differently than students who matriculate into the university after their senior year in 
high school (Hertzog & Chung, 2015).

Researcher Reflexivity

It is important to acknowledge researcher bias in qualitative studies. All three research-
ers were connected to the Center that houses the early entrance programs. This may 
have impacted both positively and negatively the way the participants responded to the 
interviewers. Some parents may have had close and positive relationships with the 
Center staff and researchers, and therefore, their responses may have been more posi-
tive. Knowing and understanding the context and participants may have contributed to 
insider information that strengthened and enhanced the honesty by which participants 
provided their views and perspectives, knowing that the researchers could be trusted 
with the confidentiality of the research. However, some parents may not have agreed 
to be interviewed if they did not have positive experiences or relationships with Center 
staff or interviewers. This is noted in the section “Implications, Limitations, and Future 
Directions” as it pertains to bias in participant sampling.

Participants and Procedure

Parents of current early entrance students were recruited by email and provided con-
sent through a Qualtrics survey in which they provided their contact information and 
availability for an interview. Semi-structured interviews were conducted from July 
2017 through January 2018 using an interview protocol. Invitation emails were sent 
out to 219 parents. In total, 52 parents responded indicating their interest in participat-
ing in the study. Researchers interviewed all 36 parents (20 EEP, 16 UW Academy) 
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who responded, consented, and were available. Seven participants still had children in 
the Transition School, and therefore, these parents had not experienced their child 
being fully matriculated into the university. Six of the total were interviewed in person 
based on the participant’s preference (see Table 1). Those who interviewed by phone 
gave permission to have their interview recorded. Their consent is included at the start 
of each transcript. Notable is the high percentage of mothers (89%) who participated 
in this study as well as the skewness of participants’ identified ethnicities (69% White, 
31% Asian).

Researchers designed the interview protocol to build upon prior research with early 
entrance to college students which focused only on student experiences (Hertzog & 
Chung, 2015; Mammadov et al., 2018). Researchers wanted to explore whether par-
ents had similar perspectives about their children’s desire, needs, and motivation for 
entering college early. Researchers asked parents about their decision-making process, 
their experiences during the transition process from middle school to the preparatory 
program for EEP, or from high school to UW Academy, their expectations for their 
children, their children’s academic and social/emotional needs, and the ways parents 
provided support for their children. Researchers also inquired about the long-term 
impact that parents believed the early entrance to college program may have on their 
children and families. The interview protocol is included in Appendix A.

Data Analysis

The authors independently coded all transcriptions. Each transcript was coded line by 
line, and in chunks of meaning by all three authors. Data displays were created in cod-
ing tables that included interview identification numbers, page numbers of excerpts, 
and quotations that matched the coding. These coding tables were discussed at research 
team meetings and facilitated discussions that promoted consensus coding. 
Discrepancies were handled by examining data displays and coming to consensus on 
excerpts that presented differences in coding. In this way, authors strengthened the 
trustworthiness of the findings. A priori codes (fixed) included the themes of each 
interview question such as the decision-making process to apply for and enroll in the 
early entrance to college program, reasons why parents or their children sought out the 
opportunity to come to college early, ways in which family life changed as a result of 
the transition, parent methods of supports, challenges experienced, and benefits of 

Table 1.  Demographic Information of Parent Participants by Program.

Program

Parents (n) Ethnicity

Father Mother White Asian

Transition School 1 6 4 3
EEP Program 1 12 9 4
UW Academy 4 12 12 4
Total 6 30 25 11
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early entrance to college. An example of the coding for student decision-making and 
autonomy can be found in Appendix B. Emergent codes were identified during the 
analysis process and also defined through consensus among the authors. The process 
of coding was iterative and required multiple readings to group parents’ perspectives 
and experiences into larger themes. In the final phase of coding, researchers derived 
salient themes that mirror selective coding (Corbin & Strauss, 2007). Authors also 
examined the clarity and salience of the codes and themes with respect to previous 
research (Hertzog & Chung, 2015; Mammadov et al., 2018; Noble et al., 2008).

Trustworthiness and Transferability

This study used purposive sampling as researchers wanted to learn about a phenome-
non from a specific perspective (Petersen, 2019). Overall, multiple participant voices 
attest to the credibility and trustworthiness of shared emergent themes identified by 
the researchers. This study had 36 total participants, who were interviewed for approx-
imately 1 hr and it resulted in more than 500 pages of transcript data. According to 
Hunt (2011; as cited in Petersen, 2019), “the focus in [qualitative] manuscripts should 
be on how and why participants were selected and, on the length and depth of inter-
views” (p. 152). In addition, the researchers of the present study provided information 
regarding context of the study so that other scholars and educational stakeholders may 
“determine if there is sufficient empirical evidence of similarity and congruence of 
context” for transferability of the findings (Petersen, 2019, p. 155). Given its context, 
this study may have applicability (Krefting, 1991) where other early entrance to col-
lege programs are concerned as well as other forms of radical acceleration.

To enhance trustworthiness, “manuscripts should include acknowledgment of per-
sonal biases (i.e., conscious and unconscious inclinations or preferences that inhibit 
objective judgment) at all stages of the research” (Petersen, 2019, p. 149). Researchers 
provided an acknowledgment of potential bias in discussing researcher reflexivity, and 
again in the limitations.

Finally, the researchers in this study provided clear presentation of how data were 
gathered and analyzed (see data displays in Appendices B and C). Three independent 
coders came to consensus and identified and chunked quotations that illuminated 
emergent themes. As such, it is important to note, the findings in this study were not 
meant to generalize, but to reflect transferability, so that the reader may apply findings 
from this study to similar situations (Petersen, 2019).

Findings

Researchers identified similar themes of parent experiences regardless of the early 
entrance program that their children attended. Thus, this section is organized to report 
the similarities first. Similar themes between programs included parents’ satisfaction 
with their children’s college academic experience, how children made their decisions 
to enroll in early entrance programs, and concerns about their children’s age in relation 
to social development and their children’s educational environment. There were also 
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differences that emerged, and were especially prominent as they related to families’ 
experiences supporting their children during their children’s time in Transition School.

Similarities Across Programs

Thriving in the academic environment.  Almost all parents observed increases in aca-
demic rigor, and also stated that their children loved the college academic experience 
and appeared to thrive in it. Parents across both programs also commented that the 
academic experience in college allowed their children to explore more options, pursue 
their interests, and find their niche. Parents liked that their children had the opportu-
nity to take courses they were excited about and commented that the college-level 
experience met their children’s needs in ways high school could not. For instance, one 
parent of an EEP student stated,

It has only impacted me in the most positive way because she comes home grinning from 
ear-to-ear even though I know she’s very tired; her eyelids are droopy and she falls asleep 
at the dinner table sometimes but she’s happy, very happy. (EEP parent interview, January 
18, 2018)

Although the college-level experience was viewed as challenging, parents were happy 
to see their children thriving in ways they had not experienced in a traditional school 
setting.

College as an appropriate environment.  In almost all cases, the transition to college was 
described by parents as an easy one, seldom reporting struggles with academics. 
Mostly, when they talked about difficulties, it was related to social aspects because 
their children wanted to stay on campus for clubs or late-night activities and could not 
stay because they had to return home, or parents had to provide their transportation. 
Because their children were too young to live in campus dormitories, several parents 
felt that their children were attending a different type of high school each day and 
returning home at night. Although some parents across both groups wanted their chil-
dren to find friends and be social, they recognized the complexities of finding friend-
ships in the larger university community. Most parents, especially parents of the EEP 
Program students were grateful for the cohort communities at the Center.

Parents said they also discussed the implications of going to college early, missing 
high school, missing their friends, and in some cases, not being able to apply to Ivy 
League schools. Yet, even when all of those topics were discussed, their children pre-
ferred to leave high school for a college environment. Children’s academic experi-
ences in their previous schools were one of the primary reasons for families to consider 
early entrance to college as a viable option. Parents indicated that there was a lack of 
challenge that led their children to feel frustrated and bored. One parent noted, “He 
was so frustrated before, the thought of three more years of high school was sort of 
more than he could bear,” (UW Academy parent interview, August 10, 2017). Parents 
reported that their children were looking for environments where other students were 
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as motivated about learning as they were and ones in which they could find more chal-
lenging curriculum and instruction.

Student autonomy and decision-making.  Another common theme of responses from par-
ents who have children in either program was the way in which they described how 
their children made the decision to come to college early. Unlike what we typically 
hear in the media about parents pushing their children, these parents said that it was 
their children who were interested in going to college early, and that it was truly their 
decision. For example, one parent noted, “We weren’t even involved other than I asked 
him to please e-mail me when he submitted [the application] so that I could know, but 
it was all, it was all him” (UW Academy parent interview, August 10, 2017). Although 
children were granted autonomy during the decision-making process, 88% of parents 
interviewed indicated that they had open conversations regarding the pros and cons of 
going to college early. Cons typically included children giving up their extracurricular 
activities such as music, clubs, and sports as well as traditional high school experi-
ences like prom. One parent noted, “also, he would miss kind of this social thing that 
happens to American students in high school,” (EEP parent interview, August 10, 
2017). The most common pro mentioned by parents focused on their children being 
with like-minded peers in a challenging environment, “I mean the real pro, I think for 
me, was that he would be with a cohort of like-minded kids, which I think has been 
very difficult for him to find” (EEP parent interview, December 1, 2017). Regardless 
of the variance within the decision-making process, parents resoundingly shared that 
the decision to attend college early was a child-driven decision.

As their children directed the decision-making process, 69% of parents inter-
viewed said that they assumed a supportive role. For instance, parents expressed the 
magnitude of the decision as a primary reason for taking the passenger seat, “We 
can’t actually make the decision as parents and we always supported her” (Transition 
School parent interview, January 18, 2018). Another parent shared, “I didn’t want to 
talk about it too much, because I was afraid I would influence her one way or the 
other, and I wanted it to be her decision” (UW Academy parent interview, August 15, 
2017). Other parents noted playing devil’s advocate with their children. One com-
mented, “We asked him questions, and we would push back and things like that, but 
we wanted him to take the lead” (EEP parent interview, November 20, 2017). 
Although some parents noted different ways in which they were involved in the deci-
sion-making process, it was clear that parents viewed their role as one of support.

Common factors that led families to consider early entrance to college as an educa-
tional alternative included their children’s unhappiness with their previous school 
experiences, lack of challenge, and the desire to be with like-minded peers. Parents 
referred to the early entrance to college program as the “right choice” (EEP parent 
interview, August 10, 2017) as a result of their children’s long history of academic 
work being “too easy” (EEP parent interview, January 18, 2018). Many parents shared 
similar sentiments stating their children were “miserable” (EEP parent interview, 
January 18, 2018), had “finished everything that they had in math” (UW Academy 
parent interview, August 8, 2017), and “wanted to be surrounded by kids who were 
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equally motivated and equally interested in going deep on subjects” (Transition School 
parent interview, January 26, 2018). Parents also noted that the early entrance program 
was “the kind of place where you recognize that these are [the child’s] people” 
(Transition School parent interview, January 9, 2018). Another notable factor (though 
not as common) involved families receiving a referral from an educator or provider, 
and parents listed information sessions, where panels of current early entrance stu-
dents answered questions, as beneficial in helping them to feel better about supporting 
their children’s decisions to accelerate radically.

Age across programs.  Age was not typically listed as a point of concern for blending in 
as a college student as long as the child physically appeared older, or had a greater 
likelihood of blending in. For instance, one parent shared, “Well, first of all, he’s six 
foot two and 200-something pounds like most kids look, unless it comes up in the 
classroom no one is going to know” (EEP parent interview, August 11, 2017). To that 
end, many of the parents also commented that their children withheld their age unless 
it was necessary to share or brought up by someone. One parent stated, “She’s found 
that her best strategy is to just keep her mouth shut about age” (UW Academy parent 
interview, November 2, 2017), and another parent responded, “With my child she 
doesn’t want people to know that she’s different, you know, she wants to fit right in” 
(EEP parent interview, January 26, 2018). Overall, parents referred to the physical 
attributes of their children and the importance of fitting in for their children.

Parents also encountered some college-level experiences where they had to step in 
and provide permission for their children to participate in a college-level activity 
(e.g., internships and lab assistantships). In some cases, parents’ concerns were 
related to their children’s age and lack of experience as it pertained to preparation for 
graduate school (medical school was frequently mentioned) and/or internships. For 
instance, one of the parents shared, “Well, she was interviewing for an internship, and 
then the guy asked can you drive, of course, so she cannot do that yet” (EEP parent 
interview, January 4, 2018). In sum, parents’ age-related concerns typically focused 
on logistical issues (e.g., transportation) and social-emotional experiences (e.g., 
dating relationships).

Concerns related to social and emotional development—Friendships.  Although parents 
were not concerned about their children’s age in terms of academic performance, 
parents did have some concerns regarding their children’s age and whether they were 
ready for university-level social and emotional experiences. One parent shared, “I 
was a bit reluctant, because my bigger concern was that he was going to be with older 
students and how that would impact him in the long-run” (EEP parent interview, 
November 30, 2017). Overall, parents struggled to let go as children developed a 
heightened sense of independence earlier than parents had originally anticipated.

Many social-emotional concerns for their children who entered early into college 
related to frequency of and the type of exposure to social interaction. To illustrate, one 
parent noted, “The social aspect was of course the biggest concern for us, as parents” 
(EEP parent interview, December 1, 2017). Some parents were concerned about the 
child’s ability to balance academics and social activities. More specifically, parents 
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were concerned that due to the intensity of the workload, their children would overly 
focus on academics and forget to make time for their social lives. One parent stated, “I 
do [worry] a little bit just because so much of her time is spent studying, and I think 
she misses out on a lot of social experiences because of that” (Transition School parent 
interview, January 9, 2018). Another parent expressed her concern regarding the lack 
of organized social interaction experiences at college, “It’s possible to go through the 
whole day in college and have no social interaction, I mean little social interaction” 
(UW Academy parent interview, November 20, 2017).

Parents described newfound tension with their children due to new social experi-
ences at college, “That’s actually maybe the first time [she] and I ever butted heads 
because of the social scene within a sorority” (UW Academy parent interview, July 31, 
2017). Some parents questioned if their children were socially ready for an adult col-
lege experience. For example, an EEP parent shared her concern regarding her son’s 
readiness for “an adult situation and not having the experience and the wisdom to do the 
right thing all the time” (EEP parent interview, January 18, 2017). Another parent 
shared this concern, “We were worried about her getting caught-up in a world that she 
wasn’t ready for and that was definitely a concern for us” (EEP parent interview, 
November 21, 2017). Parents worried how their children would react in social situa-
tions where alcohol may be present, or worried about their children being left out if a 
college study group were to meet at a bar. They voiced some concerns about their chil-
dren’s dating relationships, one parent sharing, “Well, one of the things that I am really 
concerned about is, being a young male on campus, that he doesn’t have a chance to 
meet anybody his age for a relationship” (EEP parent interview, November 30, 2017). 
Other concerns varied by gender, “some of the risks that come along with a big college 
institution, particularly for a female” (UW Academy parent interview, September 1, 
2017), and “worried about the dorm and what would it be like with him living with 
older kids and, you know, girls” (UW Academy parent interview, January 25, 2018). 
Essentially, parents were either concerned about the type of social experiences their 
children may encounter or the lack of having more typical social college experiences.

Parental expectations.  Most parents wanted their children to do their best and to follow 
their passions:

I can tell you that I really want him to like what he does. I want him to be interested in 
what he’s studying. I think with, I think if he could be passionate about it, I think the 
child could change the world in whatever it was that he was interested in. (EEP parent 
interview, January 18, 2017)

They also wanted their children to live happy, balanced lives, “The expectation was 
that she wasn’t just in an academic setting, that the social was just as important” (EEP 
parent interview, November 21, 2017). Some parental expectations showed up in areas 
of the child’s responsibility and success. For example, one parent stated, “I mean my 
expectation is that he’ll get a degree and find a career that he can support himself” 
(UW Academy parent interview, January 25, 2018), whereas another parent’s expecta-
tion meant,
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get[ting] things done on time and that’s what life is all about and that’s how we live every 
day, we have to get to things on time, . . . if you’re not ready to do that then we need to 
choose something else, a different program. (Transition School parent interview, January 
26, 2018)

Other parents’ expectations centered on their children applying to and attending gradu-
ate school.

Long-Term Impact

Parents noted that they expected positive long-term impacts in academics as well as 
social/emotional aspects on their children. Some positive aspects that were men-
tioned included more time and choice as it related to their children starting college 
earlier, “I think for my daughter, because of this early education, I think long-term 
she has more choices in her life . . . So, because of that I just think she has more flex-
ibility. I mean she can even afford to fail a few times” (EEP parent interview, 
November 8, 2017); and another parent shared, “The one thing that’s nice about doing 
all of this so early is he doesn’t feel the pressure of time” (EEP parent interview, 
October 23, 2017). More specifically, some parents looked to future opportunities, 
like graduate school or “fellowships and grants” (Transition School parent interview, 
January 10, 2018), as having the most consequential long-term impact on their chil-
dren, “I think for her as we look further down the road we talked a lot about the 
impact more at the graduate school level than anything else” (UW Academy parent 
interview, November 21, 2017). Overall, parents focused on the earlier start as an 
advantage to opening future doors for their children.

Other parents focused on the long-term impact the program had on social/emo-
tional areas. These parents included social/emotional aspects such as increased confi-
dence and personal growth. For instance, one parent shared that the program was, 
“giving him a lot of confidence in himself” (UW Academy parent interview, October 
30, 2017). Another parent noted similar observations as her daughter was in the midst 
of the preparatory program:

It has definitely given her a much stronger sense of self-confidence and validation . . . she 
can handle really tough work and she can overcome challenges [which] gives her 
confidence in a number of other ways, and that will have the biggest lasting impact that 
she might not have gotten if she hadn’t gone. (EEP Preparatory Stage parent interview, 
January 26, 2018)

An EEP parent shared,

I really think that having this much chance to grow in these early years is only going to 
help him in the future, in testing himself, what he’s capable of is only going to help him 
as far as where he’s going to be. (EEP parent interview, August 10, 2017)
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Overall, it was apparent that although parents acknowledged the challenge and rigor 
found in both the early entrance programs, they expected the long-term impact to be 
positive based on the confidence and growth already evident in their children.

Perceived Differences Between EEP and UW Academy

Challenges and stress about the preparatory program.  Parents in the EEP Program all 
commented on the tremendous work load and stress that their children had in Transi-
tion School before matriculating into the university. One parent shared, “It was hard 
for the family in seeing how busy he was and how stressed he was and just the amount 
of work he had to do and give up the expectation of family dinners or weekend outings 
together” (EEP parent interview, December 1, 2017). Yet, at the end of the program, 
these parents felt that their children gained confidence and found the transition to col-
lege easy after having such rigorous course work expected of them the year before 
entering college. “[It was] kind of thrilling and invigorating and just being faced with 
that amount of challenge I think really [it] kind of motivated him to want to do well 
and boosted his confidence” (EEP parent interview, December 1, 2017).

Parents whose children attended Transition School shared experiences of how they 
had to change and adapt their family lifestyle. They talked about reducing their social 
activities to give their children time to study. They said how difficult it was to see their 
children lose sleep and stress over the quantity of the work. Parents spoke about how 
they supported their children by insisting on taking breaks, feeding them well, and not 
expecting them to do their ordinary activities they once did with the family. For exam-
ple, one parent shared,

I was always up at five in the morning with her, because even if I was downstairs in the 
kitchen and she was in her bedroom we felt like it was a very isolating year and it was our 
job as parents to make her feel a little less isolated and a little less lonely and a little less 
on her own. (EEP parent interview, November 21, 2017)

These parents also shared how difficult it was not to know how well their children 
were doing because they were used to keeping track of their grades in a middle school 
setting—at the university level, parents are unable to obtain their children’s grade 
information. Letting go of knowing their children’s grades or trying to help them with 
their homework was extremely difficult for some parents. Researchers noted that par-
ents whose children struggled in the Transition School spoke more negatively about 
the early entrance to college experience than those whose children did well consis-
tently throughout the preparatory year.

Changes in family dynamics and lifestyle.  Although parents across both programs did 
share that their time spent together as a family had become more intentional (family 
meal times, or structured weekend walks and hiking activities), many of the differ-
ences centered on their children’s living arrangements. UW Academy parents felt as if 
they had to let go of their children sooner due to on campus living arrangements, 
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whereas EEP parents felt as if they had to let go of their children sooner due to the 
intensity of the workload in their preparatory year. Many of the parents remarked on 
household changes like fewer expectations regarding their children’s chores and 
responsibilities, “I will say she’s probably gotten by with doing less chores around the 
house and you know I’ve probably picked up the slack on that just because I know 
she’s so busy” (Transition School parent interview, January 9, 2018). EEP parents also 
felt that they had essentially lost a child for the year he or she was in Transition School: 
“I will say that during that preparatory year, we as a family felt, me in particular, I felt 
like we lost a year as a family” (EEP parent interview, November 21, 2017). However, 
after the students matriculated into the university, parents seemed to feel a sense of 
normalcy return in their families. Thus, parents had a more difficult time with the 
transition to Transition School than they did to the university.

Themes With Various Types of Responses

Disruptions in sibling relationships.  One theme that emerged in our findings was that 
sibling relationships across programs were impacted. However, the effect on these 
sibling relationships varied among families and program. For instance, some families 
experienced sibling rivalry when an older child enrolled in college only to have the 
younger child leapfrog over the high school years and join them at the university. For 
instance, one family shared that one of the largest impacts on their family was on her 
children’s relationship with one another:

Well the oldest of the two boys had a bit of a testy time because my older son worked 
extremely hard in high school and then here comes his younger brother who hasn’t done 
all that high school work and got in at the University of Washington just the same. So, he 
was resentful of that; his brother coming as he saw it, sailing in without doing all the 
work, because it is competitive to get into the University of Washington and the kids 
know that. So, he was pretty frosty about it and he actually left the University of 
Washington last year and he’s somewhere else [now]. (UW Academy parent interview, 
October 30, 2017)

However, other families noted a sense of loss when their older child accelerated and 
still had younger siblings at home:

His younger sister was a freshman last year and looking forward to being in high school 
with her brother but then he went off to college, so she has missed him tremendously 
because they’re close and they sat and did homework together for years and suddenly 
he’s gone sooner than she was expecting. As she said, I expected to lose the older brother, 
I didn’t expect to lose both my brothers at the same time. (UW Academy parent interview, 
October 30, 2017)

Another family experienced the opposite reaction by their child’s younger siblings. 
This parent noted,
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This year she moved into the dorm, and her younger siblings actually were super excited 
that she was going to be gone, because she takes up quite a bit of time at the dinner table, 
she’s an extremely vocal kid, she loves to talk and she loves to teach everybody what 
she’s just learned . . . her siblings were really excited that she was going to move out into 
the dorms because they’d finally have a chance to talk at the dinner table. (UW Academy 
parent interview, November 2, 2017)

One EEP family noted that the younger child in their family started to express a sense 
of measuring himself up to his older brother who entered college early:

The other part that we are trying to work with my [younger] son, [he] loves what he’s 
doing but sometimes when he’s frustrated with something the first thing that he says is, 
“Oh because you want me to do it exactly the same as [the older brother] is doing!” You 
know? That’s I think part of the age too because he’s young and I have the feeling that he 
has the pressure of his [older] brother too. (EEP parent interview, November 6, 2017)

Overall, parents noted changes in sibling relationships that related to competition 
between siblings or challenges in missing their sibling who enrolled early in college.

Parents’ advice.  In addition to asking parents about their experiences, researchers also 
asked parents for advice regarding ways in which early entrance to college programs 
could be improved to better meet their needs. Parents who had children in the Transi-
tion School and EEP expressed a need for more training and support for their children 
that enabled them to handle stress and manage their time better. Parents who had chil-
dren in the UW Academy, expressed a need for more support and training to teach their 
children how to advocate for themselves more and how to use the university resources 
available to them. They also expressed a desire for the Center to incorporate more 
social activities with the intention to build stronger student cohorts.

An emergent theme that arose from the parent interviews was their desire to be 
included in a stronger parent community, suggesting specific examples such as parent 
mentoring as they go through the early entrance to college process. One parent shared, 
“just talking with some of the other parents was helpful because it made you realize 
that it wasn’t just hard for your kid, it was hard for most of them” (EEP parent inter-
view, December 1, 2017). In fact, some parents expressed a sense of loss over their 
past parental peer communities when their children left the traditional high school 
setting to enter college early. One UW Academy parent echoed a similar sentiment 
among parent participants:

It definitely changed my social world, because he was in high school and his younger 
brother was still in middle school, and I no longer had—I mean I don’t hang out at the 
school all the time—but I do volunteer and participate and you know I’m an involved 
parent. So there certainly is a population of friends who I see because we’re doing those 
kinds of projects together and the next thing you know he’s in college and so you know 
that was a bit of a challenge. (UW Academy parent interview, November 20, 2017)
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Another parent shared that most of the family’s “social connections in our community 
[were] through her and through her activities so that was a big change as well” (UW 
Academy parent interview, August 15, 2017).

Although some parents felt a sense of loss for former parental peer relationships, an 
EEP parent recalled criticisms received from their former parent cohort:

I’ve had parents specifically say “oh, I would never want that for my kid,” you know, 
like, they’re not ready for college at that age. It’s like, I’m not gonna get into a debate 
about that—this is right for some kids and maybe not right for yours, like I’m not, I just 
prefer to not even go there. (EEP parent interview, January 26, 2018)

Regardless of program, parents expressed a sense of loss for their former parent 
cohorts, and expressed a strong desire for opportunities to form new parent cohorts 
with other parents of children who enrolled in college early.

Discussion

Parents interviewed for this study illuminated several issues that are addressed in 
studies about acceleration: social and emotional readiness, academic rigor, the 
optimal educational environment, and family relationships during adolescence. 
They reported their critical and supportive role that they played in the decision-
making process and overall experience. As illustrated by the findings in this study, 
the decision to accelerate is largely driven by the student, but not without parental 
support. Similar to Noble et al.’s (2008) study, parents often noted that their chil-
dren’s enrollment in early entrance to college programs was because their children 
wanted to enroll, and that taking a supportive role was more important for their 
children. This also aligns with prior findings that have identified parental support 
as a key factor for students’ success in early entrance to college programs 
(Colangelo et  al., 2004), and the effect parental involvement in their children’s 
education can have on their academic achievement and attitudes toward school 
(Jolly & Matthews, 2012).

Parents also remarked that their children were dissatisfied with their previous 
school experience, and they cited this as an influential factor to look into academic 
alternatives, including acceleration, thus mirroring another finding from Noble et al. 
(2008). Dissatisfaction typically served as the catalyst to exploring academic options 
for both parents and their children. Other similarities to the 2008 study by Noble and 
colleagues included parents’ social concerns, changes in family lifestyles and dynam-
ics, and parents’ challenges with letting go earlier than expected. For instance, parents’ 
social concerns echoed prior research that noted parents’ concerns about their children 
navigating a more adult experience at a younger age (Colangelo et al., 2004). In this 
study, parents often cited concerns about their child missing traditional school social 
events like prom, paralleling others’ findings in prior research (Noble et al., 2008). 
Although parent participants in this study recounted their challenging experiences, 
they also noted happiness with their decision and their overall satisfaction with the 
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early entrance to college experience, further supporting previous research in this 
aspect (Colangelo et al., 2004; Noble et al., 2008).

When asked to list supports parents found beneficial to them as they navigated the 
early entrance experience, they frequently mentioned parent group meetings hosted by 
the Center. More specifically, they noted that having the opportunity to meet other 
parents, essentially involvement in a parent cohort, was an important support. In some 
cases, parents referenced the challenge of losing existing parent cohorts when decid-
ing to accelerate their child and move them from the traditional school setting. Parent 
comments regarding the importance of a parent cohort provided some preliminary 
insights to the importance of looking at community factors in gifted education (Jolly 
& Matthews, 2012).

The Center has embraced working with parents to ease the transition between K-12 
and college. The participants inferred that parent cohorts are as important as student 
cohorts when making such critical life transitions. For parents who are told that when 
their children enter college, they are no longer allowed to see their children’s academic 
records without their children’s permission (FERPA laws), they may feel that they 
have to “let go” and “back off” of all things related to parenting. On the contrary, par-
ent support during the adolescent years is critical for all young people. In response to 
the findings revealed by this research, the Center designs monthly programs to bring 
parents together to support their transition with their children. Book studies with par-
ents have included Mindset by Carol Dweck (2016) and Gift of Failure by Lahey 
(2016). Topics such as communicating with your child, parental expectations, social 
media, ways to be an activist, and when not to solve your child’s problems have all 
been topics of discussion with groups of parents. Parents who are supporting their 
young children to be in an adult environment also need support.

The differences between the way parents described the transition into the prepara-
tory program and the transition into the university was concerning, and has led to 
substantial changes in the preparatory curriculum to reduce the work load and stress 
on students. Weekly “check-ins” were designed to create space for students to talk 
about how they were managing their time, their work load, or to talk about their well-
being. This check-in time is facilitated by the Academic Advisor for both early entrance 
programs. A health and wellness class taught by a school psychology student is now 
being offered to students while they are in Transition School. This is important because 
too often radical acceleration is a programming solution for the academic strengths of 
the children and not necessarily designed to address asynchronous development in all 
domains of growth. When designing early entrance programs, administrators and par-
ents should not only focus on the academic preparedness for college but also on the 
“whole” student and the well-being of the student to navigate the college environment. 
A structured time to focus on well-being is an important new component to the 
program.

Parents have expressed the desire for increased access to more information 
(Morawska & Sanders, 2009) and should have clear, comprehensive information 
pertaining to early entrance to college available to them (Colangelo et al., 2004). 
The results of this study support prior research in this regard, revealing in particular, 



22	 Journal of Advanced Academics 00(0)

parents found research-based information and discussion to be beneficial to them 
during the decision-making process and their overall experience. Furthermore, the 
findings from this study address this gap in the research and provide an in-depth 
view of the early entrance to college process as perceived by the parents. This phe-
nomenological approach to the early entrance to college experience provides addi-
tional insight for other parents who may find themselves considering early entrance 
as an academic alternative.

Implications, Limitations, and Future Directions

The findings of this study shed light on the type of environment that advanced students 
are seeking as well as the parental experiences of early college entrants. If teachers in 
middle and high schools could create contexts that allow students to develop intellec-
tual autonomy, recognize and satisfy students’ need for challenge, and provide peer 
groups where students felt that they belonged, then they may not seek an alternative 
high school experience such as early entrance to college. Takeaways of this research 
include the following conclusions:

1.	 Parents support their children who generally drive the decision-making pro-
cess to attend college early.

2.	 Although parents were worried about their children’s social lives, they reported 
that their children were mostly happy with their social lives.

3.	 Parents reported that their children gained more self-confidence after experi-
encing the struggles of the rigorous pre-college program, or the entrance into 
the university. But going into the preparatory program was particularly 
stressful for both students and families. It could be that there is an optimal 
level of challenge and perhaps 14 year olds may be more at risk to enter col-
lege early than older students. Programs similar to the Transition School may 
need to support not only academics but also the social and emotional growth, 
including attention to stress and coping with an overload of work. Perhaps 
educators should reflect upon and evaluate whether or not radical accelera-
tion (missing all 4 years of high school) is a viable option for healthy growth 
and development.

4.	 In the literature, parents reported that they need more information to help them 
become comfortable with the idea of their children attending college early. The 
experiences of parents in this study may illuminate assurances for parents that 
their children will be OK, or they may generate questions for parents to think 
about before making the family commitment to come to college early.

5.	 Parents reported that they need a cohort too—they need to share their experi-
ences with other parents whose children are going through similar experiences. 
The implication of this conclusion is for educators who are planning early 
entrance to college programs, they should include programming for parents 
that brings them together to form their own community.
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All of these takeaways have implications for families, students, and educators. 
However, there are limitations to this study. These early entrance programs are 
specific to this context, and these parents may not represent the views or experi-
ences of parents whose children are participating in other types of early entrance 
programs.

Parents who volunteered to participate in the study may have had more positive 
experiences or may have wanted to share their experiences with others as compared 
with those who did not respond to the invitation to participate. This is always a limita-
tion when asking for volunteers because they may offer biased feedback.

The demographics of the participants in this study mirror the local demographics of 
children in gifted programs in the state of Washington and in the early entrance to col-
lege programs in this university. These skewed demographics are, of course, limita-
tions to understanding perspectives from a more diverse group. Through a critical lens, 
one may wonder why there are not more diverse student populations taking advantage 
of early entrance into college programs.

The researchers are interested in pursuing a similar study with other early entrance 
to college programs to see if the experiences and perspectives of parents in this study 
are similar to other groups of parents (who may be more diverse) whose children chose 
to enter college early.

Although parents were concerned about their children’s social and emotional well-
being, their ability to make friends, and their ability to “fit into” the college environ-
ment, parents appeared to navigate those issues with their children, and did not relay 
that those concerns distressed them or their children during their college years. One 
hypothesis for this may be that students did not discuss their social lives with their 
parents once they entered into the college environment. More research into this aspect 
of the experience would shed more light in this area.

Findings on sibling tension echoed those of Gross (2004) who advocated for the 
importance of not only the support of parents and family members, but “particularly 
siblings’” support (p. 93). Gross further described the importance of sibling 
support,

where the younger child may “leapfrog” an older brother or sister, as well as what families 
can do to support sibling relationships, families where the individual strengths of each 
child are valued and praised but where it is realistically accepted, and discussed, that the 
exceptionally gifted child requires a radically different educational program, are less 
likely to have problems with sibling rivalry than families where the other children are not 
allowed to be involved in their brother, or sister’s educational planning. (p. 93)

Although tension in sibling relationships was not experienced by all families in this 
study, this theme of sibling tension/rivalry was prevalent enough (43% of parent 
responses) to emerge as a subtheme in our findings and warrants further inquiry into 
this phenomenon.

Finally, at the time of the interviews, parents could only hypothesize about the 
long-term impacts of their child’s accelerated college experience. This study focused 
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more on the transition process of the students from K-12 to college, and a future study 
may need to focus on the experiences and perspectives of parents well after their chil-
dren have graduated.

Appendix A

Interview Protocol

If you have more than one child who has been in the early entrance programs, please 
answer related to one child at a time, unless experiences are the same.

Personal information

Which program is your child currently in?
Which year did your child enter?
How old is your child?

1.	 Decisions to come to the Early Entrance Programs

Tell us about your decision-making process to send your child to college early.
Prompts:

•• What was your role?
•• What were the criteria—benefits and costs?
•• Motivation?

2.	 Transition Process

Could you please describe the transition process—from middle school to Preparatory 
Stage Program, or from HS to college?
Prompts:

•• What changes were made in the family dynamics?
•• What changes in lifestyles? Or time spent with child?
•• What challenges did you as a family or as a parent have?
•• What challenges did your child have?

3.	 Parental Expectations

In our Alumni Study, we asked students about parental expectations. Could you 
describe your expectations you hold for your child? Could you describe in more detail 
how these expectations were conveyed to them?
Prompt:
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•• Did these expectations influence you or your child’s decision to enter this 
program?

4.	 Academic Needs

Could you describe how this program is attending to your child’s academic needs?
Prompts:

•• Do you have any comparisons between your child’s previous school experi-
ences, and those that he or she is having at the University?

•• Do you have any concerns about your child’s academic growth or progress at 
the University?

5.	 Social and/or Emotional Needs

Could you describe how this program is attending to your child’s social and/or emo-
tional needs?
Prompts:

•• Do you have any comparisons between your child’s previous school experi-
ences, and those that he or she is having at the University?

•• Do you have any concerns about your child’s social and/or emotional growth or 
progress at the University?

•• Could you talk about your child’s social relationships before the program?
•• Can you describe the current social relationships of your child in the program 

and outside?
•• Could you discuss how their age may play a role in their general experiences 

related to going to college early?
•• Could you name specific supports that you see in the Robinson Center 

programs?

6.	 Long-Term Impact

•• What long-term impact do you believe the early entrance program may have on 
your child and family?

•• What do you find the most advantageous part of this program now, and what do 
you think the advantages will be in the future?

Closing questions

Do you have any advice for us?
In what ways do you think that the program should be improved to better help our 
children?



26

A
pp

en
di

x 
B

D
at

a 
D

is
pl

ay
: D

ec
is

io
n-

M
ak

in
g-

A
ut

on
om

y.

ID
Pr

og
ra

m
D

at
e

Pa
ge

(s
); 

lin
e(

s)
T

ra
ns

cr
ip

t 
ex

ce
rp

t

32
86

12
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

Fe
br

ua
ry

 2
2,

 2
01

8
2;

 1
9–

20
So

, I
 fe

lt 
lik

e 
it 

w
as

 t
he

 c
hi

ld
re

n’
s 

de
ci

si
on

 a
ny

w
ay

.
33

14
50

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
N

ov
em

be
r 

20
, 2

01
7

2;
 1

9–
22

So
, b

et
w

ee
n 

hi
s 

fr
es

hm
an

 a
nd

 s
op

ho
m

or
e 

ye
ar

 o
f h

ig
h 

sc
ho

ol
 h

e 
ca

m
e 

ho
m

e 
on

e 
da

y 
an

d 
sa

id
, I

 s
et

 u
p 

a 
m

ee
tin

g 
to

da
y 

w
ith

 [
pr

og
ra

m
 d

ir
ec

to
r]

, a
nd

 w
e 

ta
lk

ed
 a

bo
ut

 t
he

 U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y.
33

14
50

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
N

ov
em

be
r 

20
, 2

01
7

3;
 3

–6
So

, y
ou

 n
ee

d 
to

 p
ut

 o
n 

th
e 

ca
le

nd
ar

 t
ha

t 
yo

u’
re

 g
oi

ng
 t

o 
th

at
. H

e 
w

as
n’

t 
th

at
 r

ud
e 

ab
ou

t 
it,

 b
ut

 h
e 

he
ar

d 
ab

ou
t 

it,
 

he
 w

as
 e

xc
ite

d 
ab

ou
t 

it 
an

d 
I w

as
n’

t 
th

at
 e

nt
hu

si
as

tic
 a

bo
ut

 it
.

33
96

31
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

Ju
ly

 3
1,

 2
01

7
3;

 1
8–

22
It

 w
as

 t
he

 b
es

t 
de

ci
si

on
 e

ve
r 

an
d 

it 
w

as
 h

er
 d

ec
is

io
n;

 it
 w

as
 r

ea
lly

 n
ot

 o
ur

s’
 s

o 
m

uc
h,

 a
nd

 I 
kn

ow
 t

ha
t 

it 
m

ig
ht

 
be

 d
iff

er
en

t 
fo

r 
ot

he
r 

fa
m

ili
es

 t
ha

t 
w

an
t 

to
 g

et
 in

to
 [

un
iv

er
si

ty
] 

ea
rl

ie
r 

or
 w

ha
te

ve
r;

 t
hi

s 
w

as
 ju

st
 a

 p
er

fe
ct

 
op

po
rt

un
ity

 fo
r 

th
e 

pe
rf

ec
t 

st
ud

en
t.

34
03

20
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

8,
 2

01
7

26
; 1

1–
13

Be
ca

us
e 

it 
tr

ul
y 

w
as

 h
is

 d
ec

is
io

n 
an

d 
pr

ob
ab

ly
 t

he
re

 is
 a

 li
tt

le
 b

it 
of

 a
 d

iff
er

en
ce

 b
ec

au
se

 [
ch

ild
] 

is
 fa

ir
ly

 in
de

pe
nd

en
t 

an
d 

I t
ra

ve
le

d.
34

55
51

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
Ja

nu
ar

y 
16

, 2
01

8
1;

 1
9–

21
It

 w
as

 h
er

 d
ec

is
io

n.
 W

e 
to

ld
 o

ur
 d

au
gh

te
r 

th
at

; w
e 

ar
e 

no
t 

pu
sh

in
g 

he
r 

an
d 

w
e 

pu
t 

no
 p

re
ss

ur
e 

on
 h

er
; i

t’s
 h

er
 c

al
l 

an
d 

sh
e 

de
ci

de
d 

to
 g

o.
34

55
51

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
Ja

nu
ar

y 
16

, 2
01

8
2;

 1
–5

T
ha

t 
is

 w
hy

 w
e 

th
in

k 
go

in
g 

to
 c

ol
le

ge
 a

t 
an

 e
ar

ly
 a

ge
 is

 a
 g

oo
d 

m
ov

e 
an

d 
it 

re
qu

ir
es

 s
om

e 
de

gr
ee

 o
f m

at
ur

ity
, a

nd
 if

 
sh

e 
co

ul
dn

’t 
m

ak
e 

it 
on

 h
er

 o
w

n 
w

he
th

er
 s

he
 w

an
ts

 t
o 

go
 o

r 
no

t 
an

d 
m

ay
be

 s
he

 s
ho

ul
d 

no
t 

be
 g

oi
ng

 is
 w

ha
t 

w
e 

al
l t

hi
nk

.
34

74
01

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
Se

pt
em

be
r 

1,
 2

01
7

1;
 1

8–
20

Sh
e 

fo
un

d 
ou

t 
ab

ou
t 

it,
 a

nd
 g

ot
 h

er
se

lf 
en

ro
lle

d 
to

 t
ak

e 
th

e 
Sc

ho
la

st
ic

 A
pt

itu
de

 T
es

t 
(S

A
T

) 
te

st
 a

nd
 t

he
n 

le
t 

m
e 

kn
ow

 t
ha

t 
sh

e 
w

an
te

d 
to

 d
o 

it 
an

d 
w

e 
re

vi
ew

ed
 it

.
35

33
71

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
N

ov
em

be
r 

30
, 2

01
7

2;
 1

7–
22

W
el

l y
ou

 k
no

w
 t

hi
s 

w
as

 m
ai

nl
y 

dr
iv

en
 b

y 
hi

s 
ow

n 
in

te
re

st
s.

 W
e 

di
dn

’t 
kn

ow
 a

bo
ut

 t
he

 p
ro

gr
am

; w
e 

di
dn

’t 
kn

ow
 

m
uc

h 
an

d 
w

e 
ne

ve
r 

ac
tu

al
ly

 m
en

tio
ne

d 
it 

to
 h

im
 a

nd
 t

he
n 

on
e 

da
y 

he
 c

am
e 

up
 fr

om
 s

ch
oo

l s
ay

in
g 

th
at

 h
e 

ha
d 

he
ar

d 
ab

ou
t 

it 
th

e 
pr

og
ra

m
 a

nd
 h

e 
w

an
te

d 
to

 a
pp

ly
, a

nd
 h

e 
w

as
 v

er
y 

ea
ge

r 
to

 d
o 

so
.

35
33

71
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
30

, 2
01

7
3;

 3
–6

H
e 

in
si

st
ed

 a
nd

 h
e 

w
an

te
d 

to
 d

o 
it 

an
d 

yo
u 

kn
ow

 h
e 

es
se

nt
ia

lly
 a

rg
ue

d 
th

at
 h

e 
di

dn
’t 

kn
ow

 w
ha

t 
he

’d
 b

e 
do

in
g 

in
 

th
e 

la
st

 t
w

o 
ye

ar
s 

of
 h

ig
h 

sc
ho

ol
.

35
33

71
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
30

, 2
01

7
3;

 1
5–

20
I m

ea
n 

th
ey

 s
ay

 w
el

l y
ou

 k
no

w
 it

’s
 a

 g
re

at
 p

ro
gr

am
 a

nd
 t

he
 k

id
s 

ar
e 

w
el

l t
ak

en
 c

ar
e 

of
 in

 t
er

m
s 

of
 t

he
ir

 s
oc

ia
l l

ife
 

an
d 

th
e 

in
te

gr
at

io
n 

in
to

 c
ol

le
ge

 a
nd

 e
ve

nt
ua

lly
 w

e 
w

er
e 

co
nv

in
ce

d 
th

at
 it

 w
as

 p
ro

ba
bl

y 
th

e 
th

in
g 

fo
r 

hi
m

. H
e 

w
as

 
so

 a
da

m
an

t 
ab

ou
t 

it 
th

at
 w

e 
de

ci
de

d,
 w

el
l y

ou
 k

no
w

, h
e 

sh
ou

ld
 d

o 
th

is
, s

o 
th

at
 w

as
 h

ow
 it

 c
am

e 
ab

ou
t.

35
33

71
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
30

, 2
01

7
9;

 1
–5

O
nc

e 
w

e 
so

rt
 o

f s
aw

 t
ha

t 
he

 w
as

 r
ea

lly
 d

ec
id

in
g 

to
 g

et
 in

to
 it

 a
nd

 t
ha

t 
yo

u 
kn

ow
 w

e 
re

al
iz

ed
 t

he
re

 w
as

 n
o 

po
in

t 
in

 
tr

yi
ng

 t
o 

pe
rs

ua
de

 h
im

 n
ot

 t
o 

qu
it 

hi
gh

 s
ch

oo
l a

nd
 g

et
 in

to
 t

he
 p

ro
gr

am
 w

e 
w

er
e 

re
al

ly
 e

m
br

oi
le

d 
w

ith
 it

.
35

54
41

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
O

ct
ob

er
 3

0,
 2

01
7

5;
 1

2–
15

U
lti

m
at

el
y 

w
e 

le
t 

hi
m

 m
ak

e 
th

e 
de

ci
si

on
 a

nd
 w

e 
di

dn
’t 

te
ll 

hi
m

 y
ou

 w
ill

 d
o 

th
is

 o
r 

yo
u 

ca
n’

t 
do

 t
ha

t 
be

ca
us

e 
he

 is
 

ol
d 

en
ou

gh
 t

o 
ta

ke
 o

w
ne

rs
hi

p 
of

 h
is

 fu
tu

re
 a

nd
 s

o 
w

e 
al

lo
w

ed
 h

im
 t

o 
m

ak
e 

th
e 

de
ci

si
on

.

(c
on

tin
ue

d)



27

ID
Pr

og
ra

m
D

at
e

Pa
ge

(s
); 

lin
e(

s)
T

ra
ns

cr
ip

t 
ex

ce
rp

t

35
74

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
2,

 2
01

7
3;

 4
–6

W
e 

ju
st

 s
aw

 t
ha

t 
ou

r 
da

ug
ht

er
, t

ha
t’s

 w
ha

t 
sh

e 
w

an
te

d,
 s

he
 w

an
te

d 
a 

m
or

e 
ad

ul
t 

ex
pe

ri
en

ce
 w

ith
 h

er
 le

ar
ni

ng
 a

nd
 

sh
e’

s 
ve

ry
 s

el
f-

m
ot

iv
at

ed
.

35
74

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

O
ct

ob
er

 2
6,

 2
01

8
3;

 7
–8

W
e 

ju
st

 d
id

n’
t 

ge
t 

in
 h

er
 w

ay
 o

f m
ak

in
g 

a 
de

ci
si

on
.

35
81

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

15
, 2

01
7

3;
 9

–1
0

W
e 

di
dn

’t 
m

ak
e 

th
e 

de
ci

si
on

, w
e 

le
t 

he
r 

m
ak

e 
th

e 
de

ci
si

on
.

35
81

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

15
, 2

01
7

4–
5;

 1
7–

3
Sh

e 
ki

nd
 o

f w
en

t 
ba

ck
 a

nd
 fo

rt
h 

ab
ou

t 
it,

 a
nd

 t
he

n 
in

 D
ec

em
be

r,
 a

lm
os

t 
at

 t
he

 la
st

 m
in

ut
e,

 s
he

 d
ec

id
ed

 s
he

 w
an

te
d 

to
 a

pp
ly

, s
he

 a
ls

o 
m

et
 s

om
e 

ot
he

r 
pe

op
le

 in
 t

he
 p

ro
gr

am
, s

he
 w

or
ks

 a
t 

th
e 

Sc
ie

nc
e 

C
en

te
r 

an
d 

at
 t

he
 D

is
co

ve
ry

 
C

or
e 

Y
ou

th
 P

ro
gr

am
 t

he
y 

ha
ve

 t
he

re
, a

nd
 s

o 
sh

e 
ha

d 
al

re
ad

y 
m

et
 s

om
e 

pe
op

le
 a

nd
 s

he
 t

ol
d 

m
e,

 b
ef

or
e 

I e
ve

n 
m

en
tio

ne
d 

th
e 

pr
og

ra
m

 t
o 

he
r,

 t
ha

t 
sh

e 
ha

d 
lo

ok
ed

 it
 u

p 
on

 li
ne

 a
nd

 h
ad

 lo
ok

ed
 a

t 
th

e 
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y 

on
 li

ne
 a

nd
 

th
en

 s
he

 k
in

d 
of

 w
af

fle
d 

ba
ck

.
35

81
11

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
A

ug
us

t 
15

, 2
01

7
5;

 6
–9

So
, s

he
 t

oo
k 

th
e 

SA
T

 a
nd

 s
he

 c
ri

ed
 a

nd
 u

m
, y

ou
 k

no
w

, k
in

d 
of

 y
ou

 k
no

w
 le

t 
he

r 
m

ak
e 

th
e 

de
ci

si
on

 a
bo

ut
 

w
he

th
er

—
or

 t
o 

st
ay

 in
 h

ig
h 

sc
ho

ol
 o

r 
w

he
th

er
, w

he
th

er
 t

o 
go

.
35

81
11

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
A

ug
us

t 
15

, 2
01

7
5;

 1
2–

13
Sh

e 
w

as
 t

he
 o

ne
 w

ho
 m

ad
e 

th
e 

de
ci

si
on

 u
lti

m
at

el
y.

35
81

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

15
, 2

01
7

8;
 6

–9
U

lti
m

at
el

y,
 I 

th
in

k 
sh

e 
m

ad
e 

th
e 

de
ci

si
on

 a
nd

 u
lti

m
at

el
y,

 I 
do

n’
t 

re
al

ly
 k

no
w

 w
hy

, I
 d

id
n’

t 
re

al
ly

 p
us

h 
he

r 
a 

lo
t 

on
 it

 
be

ca
us

e 
I w

an
te

d 
he

r 
to

 fe
el

 li
ke

 it
 w

as
 h

er
s.

35
86

30
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
21

, 2
01

7
2;

 1
8–

20
Sh

e 
ac

tu
al

ly
 is

 t
he

 o
ne

 w
ho

 fo
un

d 
an

d 
re

se
ar

ch
ed

 t
he

 p
ro

gr
am

 h
er

se
lf 

an
d 

ca
m

e 
to

 m
e 

w
ith

 t
he

 in
fo

rm
at

io
n.

35
86

30
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
21

, 2
01

7
3;

 8
–1

6
Y

es
, s

he
 a

ct
ua

lly
 lo

ok
ed

 u
p 

bo
ar

di
ng

 s
ch

oo
ls

 p
ri

or
 t

o 
hi

gh
 s

ch
oo

l a
nd

 in
 h

er
 e

xp
lo

ra
tio

n 
fo

r 
bo

ar
di

ng
 s

ch
oo

ls
 s

he
 

fo
un

d 
in

fo
rm

at
io

n 
on

 t
he

 in
te

rn
et

 a
bo

ut
 t

he
 C

en
te

r 
pr

og
ra

m
 a

t 
th

at
 t

im
e.

 S
he

 w
en

t 
to

 a
nd

 a
pp

lie
d 

fo
r 

fo
ur

 e
lit

e 
sc

ho
ol

s 
fo

r 
bo

ar
di

ng
 s

ch
oo

l f
or

 h
ig

h 
sc

ho
ol

, b
ut

 b
ec

au
se

 o
f m

y 
in

co
m

e 
le

ve
l s

he
 w

as
 w

ai
tli

st
ed

 fo
r 

al
l o

f t
he

m
 

an
d 

de
ci

de
d 

to
 p

ul
l h

er
se

lf 
of

f t
ho

se
 li

st
s 

an
d 

en
ro

ll 
in

 h
ig

h 
sc

ho
ol

 lo
ca

lly
 w

ith
 t

he
 c

on
ce

pt
 o

f t
he

n 
pu

rs
ui

ng
 t

he
 

C
en

te
r 

Pr
og

ra
m

.
35

86
30

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
N

ov
em

be
r 

21
, 2

01
7

5–
6;

 2
2–

2
Y

ea
h,

 s
o 

m
os

t 
lik

el
y 

sh
e 

re
al

ly
 d

ro
ve

 t
hi

s 
se

ar
ch

; t
hi

s 
w

as
—

as
 a

 p
ar

en
t 

I d
on

’t 
w

an
t 

to
 p

us
h 

he
r 

to
w

ar
ds

 s
om

et
hi

ng
 

sh
e’

s 
no

t 
pr

ep
ar

ed
 fo

r 
so

 I 
al

lo
w

 h
er

 t
o 

dr
iv

e 
he

r 
ow

n 
ed

uc
at

io
na

l p
ro

gr
am

.
36

15
21

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
Ja

nu
ar

y 
25

, 2
01

8
6;

 1
9–

20
Y

ou
 k

no
w

 m
om

, I
 t

hi
nk

 I 
do

 w
an

t 
to

 a
pp

ly
.

36
15

21
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

Ja
nu

ar
y 

25
, 2

01
8

7;
 1

–5
H

e 
sa

id
 a

t 
th

at
 p

oi
nt

, y
ou

 k
no

w
, l

ik
e 

le
t’s

 ju
st

 a
pp

ly
 a

nd
 t

he
n 

w
e 

ca
n 

ki
nd

 o
f k

ee
p 

se
ei

ng
 h

ow
 it

 fe
el

s,
 y

ou
 k

no
w

. S
o,

 
it 

w
as

 s
or

t 
of

 a
n 

on
go

in
g,

 le
t’s

 g
o 

to
 t

he
 n

ex
t 

st
ep

 a
nd

 t
he

n 
w

e’
ll,

 y
ou

 k
no

w
, e

va
lu

at
e 

af
te

r 
th

at
, y

ou
 k

no
w

 k
in

d 
of

 
th

in
g.

36
43

52
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

10
, 2

01
7

2;
 1

2–
14

H
e 

ac
tu

al
ly

 c
am

e 
to

 u
s 

a 
co

up
le

 o
f y

ea
rs

 a
go

 a
nd

 s
ai

d 
th

at
 u

m
, h

ig
h 

sc
ho

ol
 w

as
 n

ot
 w

or
ki

ng
 fo

r 
hi

m
.

36
43

52
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

10
, 2

01
7

3;
 1

1–
12

So
, h

e 
ha

d 
be

en
 p

ut
tin

g 
a 

pl
an

 t
og

et
he

r 
an

d 
he

 fi
na

nc
ed

 it
 h

im
se

lf 
an

d 
he

 p
la

nn
ed

 it
 h

im
se

lf.
36

43
52

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
A

ug
us

t 
10

, 2
01

7
10

; 6
–1

0
H

e 
di

d 
th

e 
ap

pl
ic

at
io

n 
fu

lly
 o

n 
hi

s 
ow

n,
 a

nd
 h

e 
w

as
 in

 F
ra

nc
e 

ac
tu

al
ly

, w
he

n 
he

 d
id

 it
 s

o 
w

e 
ha

d 
no

, w
e 

w
er

en
’t 

ev
en

 in
vo

lv
ed

 
ot

he
r 

th
an

 I 
as

ke
d 

hi
m

 to
 p

le
as

e 
e-

m
ai

l m
e 

w
he

n 
he

 s
ub

m
itt

ed
 it

 s
o 

th
at

 I 
co

ul
d 

kn
ow

, b
ut

 it
 w

as
 a

ll, 
it 

w
as

 a
ll 

hi
m

.

A
pp

en
di

x 
B

. 
(c

on
ti

nu
ed

)

(c
on

tin
ue

d)



28

ID
Pr

og
ra

m
D

at
e

Pa
ge

(s
); 

lin
e(

s)
T

ra
ns

cr
ip

t 
ex

ce
rp

t

36
43

52
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

10
, 2

01
7

11
; 6

–9
It

 w
as

n’
t 

a 
lo

t 
of

 p
ro

’s
 a

nd
 c

on
’s

 h
e 

m
ad

e 
th

e 
pl

an
, h

e 
ca

m
e 

to
 u

s 
an

d 
sa

id
 I’

m
 d

on
e 

be
in

g 
in

 h
ig

h 
sc

ho
ol

 a
nd

 h
er

e’
s 

th
e 

pl
an

 t
ha

t 
I’v

e 
la

id
 o

ut
 a

nd
 w

e 
sa

id
 t

ha
t 

th
at

 s
ee

m
s 

so
lid

.
36

92
02

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
Fe

br
ua

ry
 2

3,
 2

01
8

2;
 1

–7
It

’s
 m

ai
nl

y 
he

r 
de

ci
si

on
 b

ec
au

se
 I 

th
in

k 
sh

e 
fe

el
s 

th
e 

hi
gh

 s
ch

oo
l, 

lik
e 

sh
e 

w
as

 t
ak

in
g 

so
m

e 
A

dv
an

ce
d 

Pl
ac

em
en

t 
(A

P)
 

cl
as

se
s 

an
d 

sh
e 

di
dn

’t 
th

in
k 

it 
w

as
 c

ha
lle

ng
in

g 
or

 e
xc

iti
ng

 e
no

ug
h 

an
d 

sh
e 

w
en

t 
to

 [
un

iv
er

si
ty

] 
to

 li
st

en
 t

o 
so

m
e 

of
 

th
e 

co
ur

se
s 

an
d 

sh
e 

re
al

ly
 li

ke
d 

it,
 s

o 
I t

hi
nk

 s
he

 w
an

te
d 

to
 g

iv
e 

it 
a 

tr
y 

so
 t

ha
t’s

 m
ai

nl
y 

he
r 

de
ci

si
on

 t
o 

go
 t

o 
ta

ke
 

on
 t

he
 E

ar
ly

 E
nt

ra
nc

e 
Pr

og
ra

m
 t

o 
en

te
r.

10
71

10
EE

P
Ja

nu
ar

y 
18

, 2
01

8
2;

 6
–8

W
e 

in
vo

lv
ed

 [
ch

ild
] 

in
 t

he
 d

ec
is

io
n-

m
ak

in
g,

 b
ut

 w
e 

ba
si

ca
lly

 in
fo

rm
ed

 h
er

 a
nd

 p
re

se
nt

ed
 h

er
 w

ith
 t

hi
s 

op
tio

n 
if 

sh
e 

w
an

te
d 

to
 d

o 
it.

10
71

10
EE

P
Ja

nu
ar

y 
18

, 2
01

8
2;

 1
8–

22
W

e 
w

er
e 

a 
lit

tle
 b

it 
ap

pr
eh

en
si

ve
, b

ut
 w

e 
ba

si
ca

lly
 w

en
t 

w
ith

 h
er

, w
ha

t 
sh

e 
w

an
te

d,
 b

ec
au

se
 it

 w
as

 r
ea

lly
 w

ha
t 

sh
e 

w
an

te
d 

to
 d

o 
an

d 
th

at
 s

he
 fe

lt 
sh

e 
co

ul
d 

de
al

 w
ith

 t
he

 p
re

ss
ur

e 
an

d 
al

so
 t

he
 e

xp
ec

ta
tio

ns
.

10
71

10
EE

P
Ja

nu
ar

y 
18

, 2
01

8
5;

 3
–1

1
W

el
l, 

w
e 

ba
si

ca
lly

 k
ne

w
 t

ha
t 

th
is

 w
as

 r
ea

lly
 w

ha
t 

sh
e 

w
an

te
d 

an
d 

it’
s 

tr
ue

 t
ha

t 
sh

e 
w

ou
ld

 b
e 

ac
ce

le
ra

te
d 

no
t 

on
ly

 
fo

r 
on

e 
ye

ar
, b

ut
 h

er
 w

ho
le

 li
fe

 r
ea

lly
. B

ut
 e

ve
n 

du
ri

ng
 t

he
 s

um
m

er
 s

he
 w

ou
ld

 r
eq

ue
st

 t
ha

t 
I a

nd
 m

y 
hu

sb
an

d 
w

ou
ld

 g
iv

e 
he

r 
ex

tr
a 

co
lle

ge
-le

ve
l c

ou
rs

es
 w

ith
 c

ol
le

ge
 p

ro
fe

ss
or

s 
fo

r 
ex

am
pl

e,
 b

ec
au

se
 fr

om
 t

he
 v

er
y 

st
ar

t 
sh

e 
w

as
 v

er
y 

in
te

re
st

ed
 in

 n
eu

ro
sc

ie
nc

e 
an

d 
ne

ur
ob

io
lo

gy
, a

nd
 s

o 
sh

e 
pr

ac
tic

al
ly

 b
eg

ge
d 

us
 t

o 
ha

ve
 a

 t
ut

or
 c

om
e 

an
d 

di
sc

us
s 

m
ed

ic
al

 jo
ur

na
ls

 w
ith

 h
er

.
10

76
60

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

10
, 2

01
8

2;
 1

6–
17

Sh
e 

fo
un

d 
ou

t 
ab

ou
t 

it 
an

d 
it 

w
as

 r
ea

lly
 t

ot
al

ly
 le

d 
by

 h
er

, o
ur

 c
hi

ld
.

11
11

32
EE

P
N

ov
em

be
r 

6,
 2

01
7

6;
 1

2–
16

So
, i

f I
 u

nd
er

st
an

d 
th

at
 c

or
re

ct
ly

 it
 w

as
 m

ai
nl

y 
[c

hi
ld

’s
] 

de
ci

si
on

 a
nd

 m
ot

iv
at

io
n 

to
 c

om
e 

he
re

 b
ec

au
se

 h
e 

w
as

 
un

ch
al

le
ng

ed
 in

 m
id

dl
e 

sc
ho

ol
; i

s 
th

at
 w

hy
? 

[P
ar

en
t]

: Y
es

 it
 is

.
11

20
20

EE
P

D
ec

em
be

r 
17

, 2
01

8
3;

 1
7–

18
[C

hi
ld

] 
w

as
 t

he
 o

ne
 t

ha
t 

w
as

 c
on

vi
nc

in
g 

bo
th

 o
f u

s,
 m

y 
hu

sb
an

d 
an

d 
m

ys
el

f.
11

20
70

EE
P

N
ov

em
be

r 
8,

 2
01

7
3;

 5
W

e 
ju

st
 w

en
t 

ah
ea

d 
to

 s
up

po
rt

 h
er

 d
ec

is
io

n.
11

24
40

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

26
, 2

01
8

4;
 1

8–
22

M
y 

ch
ild

 g
ot

 v
er

y 
ex

ci
te

d 
as

 s
oo

n 
as

 s
he

 fo
un

d 
ou

t 
ab

ou
t 

it 
an

d 
sh

e 
to

ok
 t

he
 le

ad
 o

n 
al

l t
he

 s
tu

ff 
sh

e 
ne

ed
s 

to
 d

o 
to

 
ap

pl
y 

an
d 

so
 w

e 
ju

st
 d

id
 t

he
 li

st
 t

ha
t 

sh
e 

m
ad

e 
fo

r 
us

 a
nd

, u
m

, f
ol

lo
w

ed
 h

er
 le

ad
 k

in
d 

of
, I

 g
ue

ss
 y

ou
 c

ou
ld

 s
ay

.
11

25
00

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

4,
 2

01
8

3;
 9

–1
1

N
ot

 r
ea

lly
, t

he
 s

ec
on

d 
ch

ild
 d

oe
sn

’t 
w

an
t 

to
 b

e 
th

e 
sh

ad
ow

, s
he

 r
ea

lly
 d

ec
id

ed
 o

n 
he

r 
ow

n 
an

d 
sh

e 
w

an
ts

 t
o 

pu
rs

ue
 

a 
di

ffe
re

nt
 p

at
h.

11
25

00
EE

P
Ja

nu
ar

y 
4,

 2
01

8
5;

 8
It

’s
 a

lw
ay

s 
th

e 
ch

ild
 s

o 
ju

st
 p

ro
vi

de
 t

he
m

 w
ith

 t
he

 o
pt

io
ns

 a
nd

 s
ce

na
ri

os
.

11
28

40
EE

P
O

ct
ob

er
 2

3,
 2

01
7

9;
 1

2–
20

Pa
rt

 o
f t

he
 r

ea
so

n 
I m

en
tio

n 
th

at
 is

 I 
th

in
k 

w
e 

tr
ie

d 
to

 r
ea

lly
 le

t 
ou

r 
so

n 
de

ci
de

 w
he

th
er

 h
e 

w
as

 g
oi

ng
 h

er
e 

or
 n

ot
, 

so
 it

 w
as

n’
t 

us
 s

ay
in

g 
yo

u 
ha

ve
 t

o 
do

 t
hi

s 
or

 w
e 

w
an

t 
yo

u 
to

 d
o 

th
is

. B
ut

 I 
th

in
k 

fo
r 

us
 t

ha
t 

w
or

ke
d 

ou
t 

re
al

ly
 

w
el

l, 
be

ca
us

e 
ev

en
 t

ho
ug

h 
th

e 
T

ra
ns

iti
on

 S
ch

oo
l w

as
 v

er
y,

 v
er

y 
st

re
ss

fu
l, 

th
ro

ug
ho

ut
 it

 a
ll 

ou
r 

so
n 

co
ns

is
te

nt
ly

 
sa

id
, y

ou
 k

no
w

, I
 w

ou
ld

n’
t 

w
an

t 
to

 b
e 

do
in

g 
an

yt
hi

ng
 e

ls
e;

 I’
m

 g
la

d 
I m

ad
e 

th
is

 c
ho

ic
e,

 w
ha

te
ve

r 
th

e 
ou

tc
om

e 
is

 
th

is
 h

as
 b

ee
n 

a 
go

od
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e.

A
pp

en
di

x 
B

. 
(c

on
ti

nu
ed

)

(c
on

tin
ue

d)



29

ID
Pr

og
ra

m
D

at
e

Pa
ge

(s
); 

lin
e(

s)
T

ra
ns

cr
ip

t 
ex

ce
rp

t

11
36

11
EE

P
A

ug
us

t 
10

, 2
01

7
2;

 1
7–

19
Y

ou
 k

no
w

 ju
st

 fo
r 

m
e 

it’
s 

ab
ou

t 
gi

vi
ng

 h
im

 t
he

 in
fo

rm
at

io
n 

an
d 

th
en

 t
o 

ha
ve

 h
im

 e
xp

lo
re

 t
he

 o
pt

io
ns

 a
nd

 t
hi

nk
 

ab
ou

t 
th

e 
pr

os
 a

nd
 c

on
s.

11
36

11
EE

P
A

ug
us

t 
10

, 2
01

7
3;

 4
–1

0
I d

on
’t 

kn
ow

 w
he

th
er

 I 
co

nv
ey

ed
 t

ha
t 

or
 n

ot
; I

 t
ri

ed
 n

ot
 t

o.
 I 

m
ea

n 
he

 s
ee

m
ed

 r
ea

lly
 e

xc
ite

d,
 e

sp
ec

ia
lly

 a
ft

er
 h

e 
ha

d 
th

e 
in

te
rv

ie
w

 h
er

e,
 s

o 
I t

hi
nk

 h
e 

ha
d 

de
ci

de
d 

af
te

r 
he

 h
ad

 t
he

 in
te

rv
ie

w
 h

er
e 

th
at

 h
e 

w
an

te
d 

to
 g

o 
an

d 
w

he
n 

he
 

di
d 

si
t 

in
 t

he
 c

la
ss

es
 a

nd
 s

tu
ff.

 S
o,

 I 
w

as
 ju

st
 t

o 
su

pp
or

t 
hi

m
 e

ith
er

 w
ay

 w
ha

te
ve

r 
hi

s 
de

ci
si

on
 w

as
.

11
36

12
EE

P
Ju

ly
 2

5,
 2

01
7

2;
 1

2
W

el
l h

e 
de

ci
de

d.
11

38
71

EE
P

D
ec

em
be

r 
1,

 2
01

7
4;

 3
–4

O
ur

 s
on

 w
as

 s
up

er
-e

xc
ite

d 
ab

ou
t 

it 
an

d 
sa

id
 t

ha
t’s

 d
ef

in
ite

ly
 w

ha
t 

I w
an

t 
to

 d
o.

11
41

11
EE

P
A

ug
us

t 
11

, 2
01

7
4;

 3
–4

H
e 

ju
st

 k
ep

t 
te

lli
ng

 m
e 

th
at

 it
’s

 n
ot

 w
ho

 I 
am

; i
t’s

 n
ot

 w
ha

t 
I w

an
t.

11
41

11
EE

P
A

ug
us

t 
11

, 2
01

7
4;

 1
4–

18
W

e 
di

d 
le

av
e 

th
e 

fin
al

 d
ec

is
io

n 
to

 h
im

 b
ei

ng
 t

ha
t 

th
is

 w
as

 h
is

 li
fe

 a
nd

 t
ha

t 
fir

st
 y

ea
r 

of
 t

ra
ns

iti
on

 s
ch

oo
l i

s 
de

fin
ite

ly
 

no
t 

so
m

et
hi

ng
 t

o 
be

 u
nd

er
ta

ke
n 

w
ith

ou
t 

fu
ll 

bu
y-

in
 b

y 
th

e 
st

ud
en

t.
11

41
11

EE
P

A
ug

us
t 

11
, 2

01
7

5;
 3

–5
H

e 
m

ad
e 

th
e 

de
ci

si
on

, i
t 

w
as

 h
is

 d
ec

is
io

n,
 b

ut
 I 

th
in

k 
th

at
 it

 h
ad

 t
o 

be
 h

is
 d

ec
is

io
n.

 It
’s

 n
ot

 s
om

et
hi

ng
 y

ou
 c

an
 m

ak
e 

fo
r 

yo
ur

 c
hi

ld
.

11
44

72
EE

P
N

ov
em

be
r 

20
, 2

01
7

2;
 1

8–
19

I r
em

em
be

r 
w

he
n 

he
 w

as
 e

ar
ly

 in
 E

ig
ht

h 
G

ra
de

 c
om

in
g 

to
 m

e 
an

d 
it 

w
as

 r
ea

lly
 v

er
y 

[c
hi

ld
]-

dr
iv

en
.

11
45

11
EE

P
N

ov
em

be
r 

21
, 2

01
7

2;
 5

–7
[C

hi
ld

] 
fo

un
d 

th
is

 p
ro

gr
am

 o
n 

he
r 

ow
n 

an
d 

sh
e 

be
ca

m
e 

de
te

rm
in

ed
 t

ha
t 

th
is

 w
as

 h
er

 p
at

h.
11

45
11

EE
P

N
ov

em
be

r 
21

, 2
01

7
4;

 1
3–

16
I t

hi
nk

 t
ha

t 
w

e 
w

er
e 

no
t 

su
pp

or
tiv

e 
of

 it
 a

nd
 t

he
n 

as
 t

he
 b

al
l s

ta
rt

ed
 r

ol
lin

g 
sh

e 
w

as
 t

he
 o

ne
 w

ho
 d

id
 t

he
 

ap
pl

ic
at

io
n,

 s
he

 w
as

 t
he

 o
ne

 w
ho

 s
ig

ne
d 

up
 fo

r 
th

e 
A

C
T

, s
he

 w
as

 t
he

 o
ne

 w
ho

 p
re

pa
re

d 
fo

r 
th

e 
A

C
T

.
11

45
11

EE
P

N
ov

em
be

r 
21

, 2
01

7
4–

5;
 1

9–
2

W
e 

sa
w

 t
ha

t 
sh

e 
ne

ve
r 

w
av

er
ed

; s
he

 w
as

 v
er

y,
 v

er
y 

cl
ea

r 
th

at
 t

hi
s 

w
as

 h
er

 p
at

h 
an

d 
I t

hi
nk

 m
y 

hu
sb

an
d 

an
d 

I s
or

t 
of

 
ha

d 
to

 c
om

e 
to

 t
ha

t 
un

de
rs

ta
nd

in
g 

an
d 

re
co

nc
ile

 t
he

 fa
ct

 t
ha

t 
th

e 
pa

th
 w

e 
ha

d 
la

id
 o

ut
 fo

r 
he

r 
w

as
n’

t 
ne

ce
ss

ar
ily

 
th

e 
pa

th
 t

ha
t 

sh
e 

w
as

 c
ho

os
in

g 
fo

r 
he

rs
el

f, 
an

d 
th

at
 a

t 
so

m
e 

po
in

t 
in

 t
im

e 
w

e 
di

dn
’t 

ha
ve

 a
 c

ho
ic

e.
11

45
11

EE
P

N
ov

em
be

r 
21

, 2
01

7
5;

 5
–1

2
Fo

r 
[c

hi
ld

] 
th

e 
m

om
en

t 
sh

e 
go

t 
ac

ce
pt

ed
 it

 w
as

 n
ev

er
 a

bo
ut

 <
. .

 .?
 0

0:
06

:4
0>

 s
he

 k
ne

w
 t

hi
s 

w
as

 w
ha

t 
sh

e 
w

an
te

d.
 

Sh
e 

w
as

 r
ea

lly
 c

le
ar

 t
hi

s 
w

as
 t

he
 r

ig
ht

 p
la

ce
 fo

r 
he

r.
 A

ny
 q

ue
st

io
ns

 s
he

 m
ig

ht
 h

av
e 

ha
d 

in
 h

er
 m

in
d 

w
er

e 
re

so
lv

ed
 

th
e 

da
y 

th
at

 s
he

 c
am

e 
in

 fo
r 

th
at

 in
te

rv
ie

w
 w

he
n 

sh
e 

sa
t 

in
 t

he
 [

pr
ep

ar
at

or
y 

pr
og

ra
m

] 
cl

as
s 

an
d 

sa
w

 t
he

 le
ve

l o
f 

th
is

 c
ou

rs
e 

ha
pp

en
in

g 
an

d 
sh

e 
w

as
 in

cr
ed

ib
ly

 c
le

ar
 t

hi
s 

w
as

 t
he

 r
ig

ht
 p

la
ce

 fo
r 

he
r.

A
pp

en
di

x 
B

. 
(c

on
ti

nu
ed

)



30

A
pp

en
di

x 
C

D
at

a 
D

is
pl

ay
: S

ib
lin

g 
R

el
at

io
ns

hi
ps

.

ID
Pr

og
ra

m
D

at
e

Pa
ge

(s
); 

lin
e(

s)
T

ra
ns

cr
ip

t 
ex

ce
rp

t

33
96

31
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

Ju
ly

 3
1,

 2
01

7
5;

 1
8–

23
So

, s
he

 h
as

 a
 s

ib
lin

g,
 a

 y
ou

ng
er

 b
ro

th
er

, a
nd

 t
ha

t 
ha

s 
m

ad
e 

an
 im

pa
ct

 s
o 

he
’s

 t
w

o 
ye

ar
s 

yo
un

ge
r 

an
d 

so
 h

e’
s 

al
w

ay
s 

ha
d 

to
 fo

llo
w

 in
 h

er
 fo

ot
st

ep
s,

 s
o 

I g
ue

ss
 a

s 
a 

pa
re

nt
in

g 
is

su
e,

 b
ut

 h
e 

re
al

ly
 r

es
pe

ct
s 

he
r 

so
 t

he
y 

do
n’

t 
fig

ht
 o

r 
an

yt
hi

ng
. M

ay
be

 it
’s

 b
ec

au
se

 o
f h

er
 m

at
ur

ity
 b

ut
 t

he
y’

ve
 n

ev
er

 b
ee

n 
ju

st
 t

w
o 

ye
ar

s 
ap

ar
t.

33
96

31
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

Ju
ly

 3
1,

 2
01

7
6;

 9
–1

1
Y

ea
h,

 s
o 

he
’s

 v
er

y 
pl

ea
se

d 
th

at
 s

he
’s

 h
er

e 
an

d 
ac

tu
al

ly
 s

he
 b

ro
ug

ht
 h

im
 t

o 
sc

ho
ol

 la
st

 q
ua

rt
er

 a
nd

 h
e 

ha
d 

a 
gr

ea
t 

tim
e 

he
re

 o
n 

ca
m

pu
s.

33
96

31
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

Ju
ly

 3
1,

 2
01

7
11

; 1
5–

19
H

e 
m

is
se

d 
he

r;
 t

he
y’

re
 c

lo
se

 a
nd

 h
e 

m
is

se
d 

he
r,

 y
ea

h 
so

 t
he

re
 w

as
 s

om
e.

 T
he

 h
ou

se
 is

 a
 li

tt
le

 q
ui

et
er

 a
nd

 [
ch

ild
] 

is
 n

ot
 v

er
y 

ne
at

 s
o 

th
e 

ki
tc

he
n 

flo
or

 a
s 

sh
e 

co
m

es
 in

 t
he

 r
oo

m
, y

ou
 k

no
w

 h
er

 s
ho

es
 a

nd
 h

er
 c

oa
t 

an
d 

he
r 

ba
ck

pa
ck

—
th

at
’s

 a
ll 

cl
ea

ne
d 

ou
t.

35
81

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

15
, 2

01
7

13
–1

4;
 1

9–
4

H
er

 o
ld

er
 s

is
te

r 
I t

hi
nk

 w
as

 a
 li

tt
le

 a
 t

ak
en

 b
ac

k,
 b

ec
au

se
 s

he
 w

as
 li

ke
 t

hi
s 

is
 m

y 
ye

ar
, I

’m
 g

ra
du

at
in

g,
 I’

m
 s

or
ry

 I’
m

 
ge

tt
in

g 
em

ot
io

na
l, 

um
, I

 m
ea

n 
sh

e 
fe

lt 
lik

e 
so

m
et

hi
ng

 w
as

 t
ak

en
 fr

om
 h

er
, u

m
, b

y 
ha

vi
ng

 h
er

 s
is

te
r 

ki
nd

 o
f h

av
e 

go
 

th
ro

ug
h 

th
is

—
yo

u 
kn

ow
 le

av
e 

co
lle

ge
, y

ou
 k

no
w

 le
av

e 
hi

gh
 s

ch
oo

l e
ar

ly
 a

nd
 g

et
 a

ll 
th

is
 a

tt
en

tio
n,

 s
o 

it 
w

as
 h

ar
d 

lik
e 

tr
yi

ng
 t

o 
ho

no
r 

he
r 

gr
ad

ua
tio

n 
th

at
 s

he
 h

ad
 w

or
ke

d 
ha

rd
 fo

r 
an

d 
he

r 
co

lle
ge

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e 

w
hi

ch
 is

 a
ls

o 
va

lid
.

35
81

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

15
, 2

01
7

14
; 1

2–
19

I t
hi

nk
 t

ha
t 

w
as

 p
ro

ba
bl

y 
ha

rd
 fo

r 
he

r 
be

ca
us

e 
sh

e—
in

—
sh

e 
do

es
n’

t 
ha

ve
—

sh
e’

s 
no

t 
go

in
g 

to
 h

ig
h 

sc
ho

ol
 w

ith
 a

 
si

st
er

 b
ec

au
se

 [
ch

ild
] 

le
ft

 b
ef

or
e 

sh
e 

st
ar

te
d 

um
, s

o,
 w

e 
yo

u 
kn

ow
 d

on
’t 

ta
lk

 a
bo

ut
 it

 a
 lo

t, 
bu

t 
I i

m
ag

in
e 

th
at

 y
ou

 
kn

ow
 w

as
 k

in
d 

of
—

a 
lit

tle
 h

ar
d 

to
 u

m
, b

ec
au

se
 it

 w
as

 a
 li

tt
le

 m
or

e 
ab

ru
pt

, i
t 

w
as

n’
t 

so
m

et
hi

ng
—

th
is

 w
as

n’
t 

lik
e 

so
m

et
hi

ng
 w

e 
an

tic
ip

at
ed

 o
r 

pl
an

ne
d 

on
 it

 w
as

 a
 li

tt
le

 a
br

up
t, 

tr
an

si
tio

n.
35

81
11

U
W

 A
ca

de
m

y
A

ug
us

t 
15

, 2
01

7
43

–4
4;

 2
2–

2
I m

ea
n 

I t
hi

nk
 t

he
 lo

ng
-t

er
m

 im
pa

ct
 is

 p
ro

ba
bl

y 
m

os
tly

, t
he

 p
er

so
n 

w
ho

’s
 p

ro
ba

bl
y 

m
os

t 
ef

fe
ct

ed
 w

as
 h

er
 y

ou
ng

er
 

si
st

er
, a

nd
 w

ho
 y

ou
 k

no
w

 is
 n

ot
—

do
es

n’
t 

ha
ve

 [
ch

ild
] 

ar
ou

nd
 a

s 
m

uc
h.

36
43

52
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

A
ug

us
t 

10
, 2

01
7

11
; 1

8–
21

[C
hi

ld
’s

] 
yo

un
ge

r 
si

st
er

 is
 fi

ft
ee

n 
an

d 
th

ey
 a

re
 e

xc
ep

tio
na

lly
 c

lo
se

 u
m

, a
nd

 in
 fa

ct
 t

he
y’

ve
 n

ev
er

 e
ve

r 
ha

d 
a 

ha
rs

h 
w

or
d 

be
tw

ee
n 

th
em

, i
t’s

 r
ea

lly
 k

in
d 

of
 s

tr
an

ge
, a

nd
 s

o 
fo

r 
he

r 
it’

s 
ha

rd
.

35
54

41
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

O
ct

ob
er

 3
0,

 2
01

7
10

; 5
–9

A
s 

a 
fa

m
ily

 t
he

 im
pa

ct
 w

as
 t

he
 b

ig
ge

st
 o

n 
hi

s 
si

bl
in

gs
 b

ec
au

se
 h

is
 o

ld
er

 b
ro

th
er

 w
as

 g
oi

ng
 o

ff 
to

 c
ol

le
ge

 a
nd

 n
ow

 t
he

 
ki

d 
br

ot
he

r 
is

 fo
llo

w
in

g 
ri

gh
t 

be
hi

nd
 h

im
 w

hi
ch

 h
e 

w
as

n’
t 

ha
pp

y 
ab

ou
t.

35
54

41
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

O
ct

ob
er

 3
0,

 2
01

7
10

; 1
2–

20
O

th
er

 im
pa

ct
 a

s 
fa

r 
as

 h
is

 s
ib

lin
gs

 is
 h

is
 y

ou
ng

er
 s

is
te

r 
w

as
 a

 fr
es

hm
an

 la
st

 y
ea

r 
an

d 
lo

ok
in

g 
fo

rw
ar

d 
to

 b
ei

ng
 in

 h
ig

h 
sc

ho
ol

 w
ith

 h
er

 b
ro

th
er

 b
ut

 t
he

n 
he

 w
en

t 
of

f t
o 

co
lle

ge
, s

o.
 S

he
 h

as
 m

is
se

d 
hi

m
 t

re
m

en
do

us
ly

 b
ec

au
se

 t
he

y’
re

 
cl

os
e 

an
d 

th
ey

 s
at

 a
nd

 d
id

 h
om

ew
or

k 
to

ge
th

er
 fo

r 
ye

ar
s 

an
d 

su
dd

en
ly

 s
he

’s
 g

on
e 

so
on

er
 t

ha
n 

sh
e 

w
as

 e
xp

ec
tin

g.
 

A
s 

sh
e 

sa
id

, I
 e

xp
ec

te
d 

to
 lo

se
 t

he
 o

ld
er

 b
ro

th
er

, I
 d

id
n’

t 
ex

pe
ct

 t
o 

lo
se

 b
ot

h 
m

y 
br

ot
he

rs
 a

t 
th

e 
sa

m
e 

tim
e.

(c
on

tin
ue

d)



31

ID
Pr

og
ra

m
D

at
e

Pa
ge

(s
); 

lin
e(

s)
T

ra
ns

cr
ip

t 
ex

ce
rp

t

35
54

41
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

O
ct

ob
er

 3
0,

 2
01

7
11

–1
2;

 1
1–

5
W

el
l t

he
 o

ld
es

t 
tw

o 
bo

ys
 h

ad
 a

 b
it 

of
 a

 t
es

ty
 t

im
e 

be
ca

us
e 

m
y 

ol
de

r 
so

n 
w

or
ke

d 
ex

tr
em

el
y 

ha
rd

 in
 h

ig
h 

sc
ho

ol
 a

nd
 

th
en

 h
er

e 
co

m
es

 h
is

 y
ou

ng
er

 b
ro

th
er

 w
ho

 h
as

n’
t 

do
ne

 a
ll 

th
at

 h
ig

h 
sc

ho
ol

 w
or

k 
an

d 
go

t 
in

 a
t 

th
e 

U
ni

ve
rs

ity
 o

f 
W

as
hi

ng
to

n 
ju

st
 t

he
 s

am
e.

 S
o,

 h
e 

w
as

 r
es

en
tf

ul
 o

f t
ha

t; 
hi

s 
br

ot
he

r 
co

m
in

g 
as

 h
e 

sa
w

 it
, s

ai
lin

g 
in

 w
ith

ou
t 

do
in

g 
al

l t
he

 w
or

k,
 b

ec
au

se
 it

 is
 c

om
pe

tit
iv

e 
to

 g
et

 in
to

 U
W

 a
nd

 t
he

 k
id

s 
kn

ow
 t

ha
t. 

So
, h

e 
w

as
 p

re
tt

y 
fr

os
ty

 a
bo

ut
 it

 
an

d 
he

 a
ct

ua
lly

 le
ft

 t
he

 U
ni

ve
rs

ity
 o

f W
as

hi
ng

to
n 

la
st

 y
ea

r 
an

d 
he

’s
 s

om
ew

he
re

 e
ls

e 
be

ca
us

e 
he

—
I c

an
’t 

sa
y 

th
at

’s
 

be
ca

us
e 

hi
s 

br
ot

he
r 

w
as

 t
he

re
 b

ec
au

se
 I 

do
n’

t 
th

in
k 

it’
s 

th
at

 d
ir

ec
t 

co
rr

el
at

io
n,

 b
ut

 it
 d

id
 h

av
e 

an
 im

pa
ct

 o
n 

th
e 

tw
o 

of
 t

he
m

. T
he

y’
re

 g
et

tin
g 

pa
st

 t
ha

t 
bu

t 
yo

u 
kn

ow
 la

st
 y

ea
r 

m
y 

ol
de

st
 s

on
 w

as
 p

re
tt

y 
re

se
nt

fu
l t

ha
t 

hi
s 

yo
un

ge
r 

br
ot

he
r 

ju
st

 g
ot

 in
 k

in
d 

of
 fo

r 
fr

ee
, i

f y
ou

 w
ill

, m
ea

ni
ng

 w
ith

ou
t 

do
in

g 
al

l t
he

 h
ar

d 
hi

gh
-s

ch
oo

l w
or

k 
an

d 
SA

T
s 

an
d 

w
or

ry
in

g 
ab

ou
t 

th
e 

G
PA

 a
nd

 y
ou

 k
no

w
 a

ll 
th

e 
ac

tiv
iti

es
 a

nd
 c

lu
bs

. S
o 

th
at

 w
as

 a
n 

im
pa

ct
.

35
74

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
2,

 2
01

7
15

; 2
–7

T
hi

s 
ye

ar
 t

ha
t 

sh
e 

m
ov

ed
 in

to
 t

he
 d

or
m

, a
nd

 h
er

 y
ou

ng
er

 s
ib

lin
gs

 a
ct

ua
lly

 w
er

e 
su

pe
r 

ex
ci

te
d 

th
at

 s
he

 w
as

 g
oi

ng
 

to
 b

e 
go

ne
, b

ec
au

se
 s

he
 t

ak
es

 u
p 

qu
ite

 a
 b

it 
of

 t
im

e 
at

 t
he

 d
in

ne
r 

ta
bl

e,
 s

he
’s

 a
n 

ex
tr

em
el

y 
vo

ca
l k

id
, s

he
 lo

ve
s 

to
 

ta
lk

 a
nd

 s
he

 lo
ve

s 
to

 t
ea

ch
 e

ve
ry

bo
dy

 w
ha

t 
sh

e’
s 

ju
st

 le
ar

ne
d.

35
74

11
U

W
 A

ca
de

m
y

N
ov

em
be

r 
2,

 2
01

7
15

; 1
7–

19
H

er
 s

ib
lin

gs
 w

er
e 

re
al

ly
 e

xc
ite

d 
th

at
 s

he
’s

 w
as

 g
oi

ng
 t

o 
m

ov
e 

ou
t 

in
to

 t
he

 d
or

m
s 

be
ca

us
e 

th
ey

’d
 fi

na
lly

 h
av

e 
a 

ch
an

ce
 t

o 
ta

lk
 a

t 
th

e 
di

nn
er

 t
ab

le
.

10
71

10
EE

P
Ja

nu
ar

y 
18

, 2
01

8
7;

 1
–6

T
he

 t
hi

ng
 is

 [
ch

ild
] 

an
d 

[c
hi

ld
] 

ha
ve

 fi
ve

 y
ea

rs
 b

et
w

ee
n 

th
em

 a
nd

 s
o 

fr
om

 t
he

 v
er

y 
be

gi
nn

in
g,

 e
ve

n 
be

fo
re

 T
ra

ns
iti

on
 

Sc
ho

ol
 it

 a
lw

ay
s 

fe
lt 

lik
e 

w
e 

ha
d 

tw
o 

on
ly

-c
hi

ld
re

n 
an

yw
ay

. S
o 

[c
hi

ld
] 

w
ou

ld
 h

av
e 

hi
s 

ow
n 

in
te

re
st

s 
an

d 
[c

hi
ld

] 
w

ou
ld

 h
av

e 
he

r 
ow

n 
so

 it
 d

id
n’

t 
re

al
ly

 a
ffe

ct
 t

he
ir

 in
te

ra
ct

io
n 

to
o 

m
uc

h.
10

71
10

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

18
, 2

01
8

21
; 1

1–
14

It
 d

id
 h

av
e 

an
 im

pa
ct

 o
n 

ou
r 

so
n 

be
ca

us
e 

w
e 

tr
y 

no
t 

to
 p

ra
is

e 
ou

r 
da

ug
ht

er
 t

oo
 m

uc
h 

in
 fr

on
t 

of
 h

im
 b

ec
au

se
 h

e 
is

 
a 

ve
ry

 s
en

si
tiv

e 
ch

ild
 a

nd
 w

e’
re

 ju
st

 a
fr

ai
d 

th
at

 w
e 

w
ou

ld
 b

e 
in

st
ill

in
g 

so
m

e 
ki

nd
 o

f e
xp

ec
ta

tio
n 

on
to

 h
im

.
10

71
10

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

18
, 2

01
8

21
; 1

5–
17

Bu
t 

ev
en

 w
ith

 u
s 

le
ss

 p
ra

is
in

g 
he

r 
an

d 
yo

u 
kn

ow
 w

ith
 h

im
 p

re
se

nt
 w

e 
fe

el
 t

ha
t 

he
 is

 s
om

eh
ow

 p
re

ss
ur

ed
 t

o 
do

 a
s 

w
el

l, 
if 

no
t 

be
tt

er
, a

s 
hi

s 
si

st
er

.
10

71
10

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

18
, 2

01
8

22
; 1

–4
Bu

t 
he

 w
as

 u
nd

er
 a

 lo
t 

of
 p

re
ss

ur
e 

an
d 

he
’s

 o
nl

y 
ni

ne
-y

ea
rs

-o
ld

, a
nd

 w
e 

ba
si

ca
lly

 t
ol

d 
hi

m
 t

ha
t 

it 
w

as
 u

nh
ea

lth
y;

 t
ha

t 
th

is
 is

 n
ot

 t
he

 k
in

d 
of

 c
om

pe
tit

io
n 

w
e 

w
an

t 
in

 o
ur

 fa
m

ily
.

10
71

10
EE

P
Ja

nu
ar

y 
18

, 2
01

8
22

; 7
–1

4
H

e 
w

as
—

w
e 

do
 h

om
ew

or
k 

to
ge

th
er

 a
nd

 h
e 

w
ou

ld
 ju

st
 b

re
ak

 d
ow

n 
an

d 
cr

y 
an

d 
he

 w
ou

ld
 s

ay
, y

ou
 k

no
w

 I 
w

is
h 

I 
w

as
 m

or
e 

lik
e 

[c
hi

ld
]; 

I’m
 d

um
b.

 S
o 

ba
si

ca
lly

, h
e 

w
ou

ld
 c

ry
 a

nd
 h

e 
w

ou
ld

 s
ho

w
 is

 fr
us

tr
at

io
n,

 b
ut

 I 
di

d 
se

t-
up

 a
 

m
ee

tin
g 

w
ith

 h
is

 t
ea

ch
er

 a
nd

 h
is

 c
ou

ns
el

or
 a

nd
 w

e 
ta

lk
ed

 it
 o

ut
 a

nd
 I 

re
m

in
d 

hi
m

 e
ve

ry
 d

ay
 is

 t
ha

t 
al

l w
e 

w
an

t 
fo

r 
hi

m
 is

 t
o 

do
 h

is
 b

es
t 

an
d 

no
t 

to
 b

as
ic

al
ly

 lo
ok

 a
t 

hi
s 

si
st

er
 a

s 
a 

ya
rd

st
ic

k.
11

24
40

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

26
, 2

01
8

16
; 6

–1
0

Fo
r 

m
y 

tw
o 

yo
un

ge
r 

ki
ds

 it
 w

as
 a

 r
ea

lly
 t

ou
gh

 y
ea

r 
fo

r 
th

em
 a

nd
 t

he
y,

 u
m

, I
, I

 r
em

em
be

r 
sp

ec
ifi

c 
m

om
en

ts
 o

f t
he

m
 

bo
th

 c
ry

in
g,

 li
te

ra
lly

 c
ry

in
g,

 t
he

 y
ou

ng
er

 s
ib

lin
gs

 t
ha

t 
sh

e 
do

es
n’

t 
lo

ve
 t

he
m

 a
ny

m
or

e 
be

ca
us

e 
sh

e 
ne

ve
r 

do
es

 
an

yt
hi

ng
 w

ith
 t

he
m

.

A
pp

en
di

x 
C

. 
(c

on
ti

nu
ed

)

(c
on

tin
ue

d)



32

ID
Pr

og
ra

m
D

at
e

Pa
ge

(s
); 

lin
e(

s)
T

ra
ns

cr
ip

t 
ex

ce
rp

t

11
24

40
EE

P
Ja

nu
ar

y 
26

, 2
01

8
18

; 7
–1

1
Y

ou
 c

an
 in

vi
te

 m
e 

bu
t 

do
n’

t 
be

 m
ad

e 
if 

I c
an

’t 
co

m
e,

 y
ou

 k
no

w
, a

nd
 t

ha
t’s

 w
ha

t 
w

e 
di

d,
 w

el
l w

e 
di

d 
ou

r 
be

st
 n

ot
 t

o 
ta

ke
 it

 p
er

so
na

lly
 y

ou
 c

ou
ld

 s
ay

. Y
ou

 k
no

w
, m

y 
ot

he
r 

tw
o 

ki
ds

 s
om

et
im

es
 t

ak
e 

it 
pe

rs
on

al
ly

.
11

28
40

EE
P

O
ct

ob
er

 2
3,

 2
01

7
19

; 1
9–

21
I t

hi
nk

 a
no

th
er

 t
hi

ng
, I

 d
on

’t 
th

in
k 

w
e 

m
an

ag
ed

 t
he

 s
itu

at
io

n 
w

ith
 m

y 
da

ug
ht

er
 a

s 
w

el
l a

s 
w

e 
pr

ob
ab

ly
 c

ou
ld

 h
av

e.
11

28
40

EE
P

O
ct

ob
er

 2
3,

 2
01

7
20

; 1
–5

I m
ea

n 
I t

hi
nk

 [
si

st
er

] 
st

ill
 h

as
 a

 c
er

ta
in

 le
ve

l o
f r

es
en

tm
en

t 
fo

r 
be

in
g 

pu
lle

d 
ou

t 
of

 h
er

 e
nv

ir
on

m
en

t. 
Y

ou
 k

no
w

 
th

er
e 

w
er

e 
m

ul
tip

le
 r

ea
so

ns
 w

hy
 w

e 
m

ad
e 

th
e 

tr
an

si
tio

n 
ba

ck
 h

er
e,

 b
ut

 t
he

 p
ri

m
ar

y 
dr

iv
er

 w
as

 o
ur

 s
on

 b
ei

ng
 

ad
m

itt
ed

 in
to

 t
hi

s 
pr

og
ra

m
.

11
28

40
EE

P
O

ct
ob

er
 2

3,
 2

01
7

20
; 5

–9
So

 e
ve

n 
ju

st
 t

hi
s 

m
or

ni
ng

 s
he

 w
as

 s
ay

in
g 

so
m

et
hi

ng
 a

bo
ut

 h
ow

 o
h 

m
y 

br
ot

he
r 

is
 t

he
 r

ea
l s

m
ar

t 
on

e 
an

d 
sh

e’
s 

go
tt

en
 

a 
so

rt
 o

f n
eg

at
iv

e 
se

lf-
im

ag
e 

in
 a

 w
ay

. I
 d

on
’t 

th
in

k 
w

e’
ve

 d
on

e 
an

yt
hi

ng
 t

o 
en

co
ur

ag
e 

he
r 

to
 t

hi
nk

 t
ha

t 
w

ay
.

11
28

40
EE

P
O

ct
ob

er
 2

3,
 2

01
7

20
; 2

0–
22

So
, [

si
st

er
] 

to
ok

 t
he

 t
es

t 
bu

t 
sh

e 
di

d 
ve

ry
 b

ad
ly

, s
o 

sh
e 

di
dn

’t 
ge

t 
bu

m
pe

d 
up

, w
hi

ch
 is

 g
oo

d;
 I 

do
n’

t 
w

an
t 

th
em

 t
o 

ad
va

nc
e 

he
r 

if 
sh

e’
s 

no
t 

ca
pa

bl
e 

of
 it

.
11

28
40

EE
P

O
ct

ob
er

 2
3,

 2
01

7
21

; 3
–7

Bu
t 

I t
hi

nk
 t

ha
t 

ha
s 

ki
nd

 o
f i

m
pa

ct
ed

 h
er

 t
oo

, e
sp

ec
ia

lly
 b

ec
au

se
 h

er
 b

ro
th

er
 is

 s
o 

sk
ill

ed
 a

t 
m

at
h.

 S
o 

st
ill

 t
hi

nk
in

g 
ab

ou
t 

ho
w

 t
o 

de
al

 w
ith

 h
er

 s
el

f-
im

ag
e 

is
su

es
 in

 r
el

at
io

n 
to

 t
he

 d
yn

am
ic

s 
be

tw
ee

n 
th

em
.

11
38

71
EE

P
D

ec
em

be
r 

1,
 2

01
7

9–
10

; 2
3–

7
I t

hi
nk

 t
he

re
 is

 a
 p

ar
t 

of
 m

e 
th

at
 t

hi
nk

s 
it 

w
as

 h
ar

d 
fo

r 
hi

s 
yo

un
ge

r 
si

bl
in

g,
 w

ho
 is

 t
hr

ee
 y

ea
rs

 y
ou

ng
er

 a
nd

 t
he

y 
do

 n
ot

 h
av

e 
a 

ve
ry

 c
lo

se
 r

el
at

io
ns

hi
p 

bu
t 

a 
pa

rt
 o

f m
e 

th
in

ks
 w

el
l t

ha
t’s

 k
in

d 
of

 w
hy

 h
e’

s 
th

e 
gu

lf 
be

tw
ee

n 
th

er
e 

be
ca

us
e 

th
e 

th
re

e 
ye

ar
s 

es
se

nt
ia

lly
 b

ec
am

e 
si

x 
or

 s
ev

en
 y

ea
rs

 in
 t

er
m

s 
of

 h
ow

 t
he

y’
re

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
in

g 
lif

e,
 s

o 
I d

on
’t 

th
in

k 
th

at
 h

el
pe

d 
th

ei
r 

re
la

tio
ns

hi
p 

an
y.

11
38

71
EE

P
D

ec
em

be
r 

1,
 2

01
7

10
; 1

6–
18

Bu
t 

I t
hi

nk
 a

t 
th

at
 a

ge
 w

he
re

 it
’s

 ju
st

 a
 r

ea
lly

 la
rg

e 
gu

lf 
an

d 
th

is
 m

ay
 b

e 
w

id
en

ed
 it

 a
 li

tt
le

 b
it.

11
45

11
EE

P
N

ov
em

be
r 

21
, 2

01
7

7–
8;

 1
9–

1
M

y 
hu

sb
an

d 
an

d 
I w

er
e 

ve
ry

, v
er

y 
co

ns
ci

ou
s 

of
 t

he
 fa

ct
 t

ha
t 

he
 is

 a
s 

br
ig

ht
 a

s 
sh

e 
is

 s
o 

w
e 

ne
ed

ed
 h

im
 t

o 
un

de
rs

ta
nd

 t
ha

t 
th

is
 w

as
 n

ot
 t

he
 e

xp
ec

ta
tio

n;
 t

hi
s 

w
as

 n
ot

 t
he

 g
oa

l a
nd

 t
hi

s 
w

as
 n

ot
 t

he
 b

ar
 t

ha
t 

ou
r 

fa
m

ily
 w

as
 

se
tt

in
g 

fo
r 

su
cc

es
s.

11
20

20
EE

P
N

ov
em

be
r 

6,
 2

01
7

12
; 8

–1
1

T
he

n 
th

e 
ot

he
r 

th
in

g 
is

 b
ec

au
se

 o
f w

ha
t 

[c
hi

ld
] 

is
 d

oi
ng

 I 
st

ar
te

d 
fe

el
in

g 
th

at
 m

y 
yo

un
ge

st
 s

on
 w

as
 a

lw
ay

s 
th

in
ki

ng
 

th
at

 h
e 

ha
d 

to
 b

e 
lik

e 
[c

hi
ld

].
11

20
20

EE
P

N
ov

em
be

r 
6,

 2
01

7
12

; 1
6–

22
T

he
 o

th
er

 p
ar

t 
th

at
 w

e 
ar

e 
tr

yi
ng

 t
o 

w
or

k 
w

ith
 m

y 
so

n,
 [

ch
ild

] 
lo

ve
s 

w
ha

t 
he

’s
 d

oi
ng

 b
ut

 s
om

et
im

es
 w

he
n 

he
’s

 
fr

us
tr

at
ed

 w
ith

 s
om

et
hi

ng
 t

he
 fi

rs
t 

th
in

g 
th

at
 h

e 
sa

ys
 is

, o
h 

be
ca

us
e 

yo
u 

w
an

t 
m

e 
to

 d
o 

it 
ex

ac
tly

 t
he

 s
am

e 
as

 
[b

ro
th

er
] 

is
 d

oi
ng

! Y
ou

 k
no

w
? 

T
ha

t’s
 I 

th
in

k 
pa

rt
 o

f t
he

 a
ge

 t
oo

 b
ec

au
se

 h
e’

s 
yo

un
g 

an
d 

I h
av

e 
th

e 
fe

el
in

g 
th

at
 h

e 
ha

s 
th

e 
pr

es
su

re
 o

f h
is

 b
ro

th
er

 t
oo

.
10

73
30

EE
P

Ja
nu

ar
y 

20
, 2

01
8

16
; 1

1–
15

T
he

 o
ld

es
t 

ch
ild

 w
as

 p
re

tt
y 

pr
ou

d 
of

 [
ch

ild
], 

so
 b

ot
h 

of
 t

he
m

 w
er

e 
pr

ou
d.

 T
he

 m
id

dl
e 

ch
ild

 I 
th

in
k 

fe
lt 

a 
lit

tle
 b

it 
th

at
 m

ay
 b

e 
ev

en
 a

 s
ha

do
w

, y
ou

 k
no

w
 h

ow
 e

ve
ry

bo
dy

 c
om

es
 a

nd
 s

ay
s 

oh
 [

ch
ild

] 
yo

u’
re

 s
up

er
 s

m
ar

t, 
an

d 
<

. .
 .?

 
00

:2
9:

43
>

 is
 n

ot
 s

up
er

 s
m

ar
t?

N
ot

e.
 U

W
 =

 U
ni

ve
rs

ity
 o

f W
as

hi
ng

to
n;

 G
PA

 =
 g

ra
de

 p
oi

nt
 a

ve
ra

ge
.

A
pp

en
di

x 
C

. 
(c

on
ti

nu
ed

)



Hertzog et al.	 33

Declaration of Conflicting Interests

The authors declared no potential conflicts of interest with respect to the research, authorship, 
and/or publication of this article.

Funding

The authors received no financial support for the research, authorship, and/or publication of this 
article.

ORCID iD

Nancy B. Hertzog  https://orcid.org/0000-0001-6471-7463

References

Acceleration Institute. (n.d.-a). 20 types of acceleration. http://www.accelerationinstitute.org/
Resources/acceleration_types.aspx

Acceleration Institute. (n.d.-b). Parents. https://www.accelerationinstitute.org/parents.aspx
Assouline, S. G., Colangelo, N., VanTassel-Baska, J., & Lupkowski-Shoplik, A. (2015). A 

nation empowered: Evidence trumps the excuses holding back America’s brightest students. 
Colorweb Printing.

Boazman, J., & Sayler, M. (2011). Personal well-being of gifted students following participation 
in an early college entrance program. Roeper Review, 33, 76–85. https://doi.org/10.1080 
/02783193.201.554153

Brody, L. E., Muratori, M. C., & Stanley, J. C. (2004). Early entrance to college: Academic, 
social, and emotional considerations. In N. Colangelo, S. G. Assouline, & M. U. M. Gross 
(Eds.), A nation deceived: How schools hold back America’s brightest students (pp. 97–
107). https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf

Colangelo, N., Assouline, S. G., & Gross, M. U. M. (2004). A nation deceived: How schools 
hold back America’s brightest students. The Templeton National Report on Acceleration 
(ED535138). https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf

Colangelo, N., Assouline, S. G., Marron, M. A., et al. (2010). Guidelines for developing an 
academic acceleration policy. National Work Group on acceleration. Journal of Advanced 
Academics, 21(2), 180–203.

Corbin, J., & Strauss, A. (2007). Basics of qualitative research: Techniques and procedures for 
developing grounded theory (3rd ed.). Sage.

Dai, D. Y., & Steenbergen-Hu, S. (2015). Special class for the gifted young: A 34-year experi-
mentation with early college entrance programs in China. Roeper Review, 37, 9–18. https://
doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2014.975882

Dai, D. Y., Steenbergen-Hu, S., & Zhou, Y. (2015). Cope and grow: A grounded theory approach 
to early college entrants’ lived experiences and changes in a STEM program. Gifted Child 
Quarterly, 59, 75–90. https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986214568719

Davidson Institute. (n.d.). Educational options: Acceleration. http://www.davidsongifted.org/
Search-Database/topic/105164/entryType/1

Dweck, C. S. (2016). Mindset: The new psychology of success. Ballentine Books.
Gross, M. U. M. (2004). Radical acceleration. In N. Colangelo, S. G. Assouline, & M. U. M. 

Gross (Eds.), A nation deceived: How schools hold back America’s brightest students  
(pp. 87–96). https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf

https://orcid.org/0000-0001-6471-7463
http://www.accelerationinstitute.org/Resources/acceleration_types.aspx
http://www.accelerationinstitute.org/Resources/acceleration_types.aspx
https://www.accelerationinstitute.org/parents.aspx
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.201.554153
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.201.554153
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2014.975882
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2014.975882
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986214568719
http://www.davidsongifted.org/Search-Database/topic/105164/entryType/1
http://www.davidsongifted.org/Search-Database/topic/105164/entryType/1
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf


34	 Journal of Advanced Academics 00(0)

Hébert, T. P., Pagnani, A. R., & Hammond, D. R. (2009). An examination of paternal influence 
on high-achieving gifted males. Journal for the Education of the Gifted, 33, 241–274.

Hertzog, N. B., & Chung, R. U. (2015). Outcomes for students on a fast track to college: Early 
college entrance programs at the University of Washington. Roeper Review, 37, 39–49. 
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2014.976324

Hoogeveen, L., van Hell, J. G., & Verhoeven, L. (2012). Social-emotional characteristics of 
gifted accelerated and non-accelerated students in the Netherlands. British Journal of 
Educational Psychology, 82, 585–605.

Jolly, J. L., & Matthews, M. S. (2012). A critique of the literature on parenting 
gifted learners. Journal for the Education of the Gifted, 35, 259–290. https://doi.
org/10.1177/0162353212451703

Krefting, L. (1991). Rigor in qualitative research: The assessment of trustworthiness. American 
Journal of Occupational Therapy, 45(3), 214–222.

Lahey, J. (2016). The gift of failure: How the best parents learn to let go so their children can 
succeed. HarperCollins.

Lee, S., Olszewski-Kubilius, P., & Peternel, G. (2010). The efficacy of academic accel-
eration for gifted minority students. Gifted Child Quarterly, 54, 189–208. https://doi.
org/10.1177/0016986210369256

Mammadov, S., Hertzog, N. B., & Mun, R. U. (2018). An examination of self-determination 
within alumni of an early college entrance program. Journal for the Education of the Gifted, 
41, 273–291. https://doi.org/10.1177/0162353218781745

Morawska, A., & Sanders, M. R. (2009). Parenting gifted and talented children: Conceptual 
and empirical foundations. Gifted Child Quarterly, 53, 163–173. https://doi.
org/10.1177/0016986209334962

National Association for Gifted Children. (n.d.). Acceleration. https://www.nagc.org/resources-
publications/gifted-education-practices/acceleration

Noble, K. D., Childers, S. A., & Vaughan, R. C. (2008). A place to be celebrated and under-
stood: The impact of early university entrance from parents’ points of view. Gifted Child 
Quarterly, 52, 256–268. https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986208319976

Park, G., Lubinski, D., Benbow, C. P., & Graesser, A. C. (2013). When less is more: Effects of 
grade skipping on adult STEM productivity among mathematically precocious adolescents. 
Journal of Educational Psychology, 105, 176–198. https://doi.org/10.1037/a0029481

Petersen, J. S. (2019). Presenting a qualitative study: A reviewer’s perspective. Gifted Child 
Quarterly, 63, 147–158.

Robinson, N. (2004). Effects of academic acceleration on the social-emotional status of gifted 
students. In N. Colangelo, S. G. Assouline, & M. U. M. Gross (Eds.), A nation deceived: 
How schools hold back America’s brightest students (pp. 59–67). https://files.eric.ed.gov/
fulltext/ED535138.pdf

Robinson Center for Young Scholars. (n.d.). Research. https://robinsoncenter.uw.edu/research/
Rogers, K. B., & Kimpston, R. D. (1992). Acceleration: What we do vs. what we know. 

Educational Leadership, 50(2), 58–61.
Rubenstein, L. D., Schelling, N., Wilczynski, S. M., & Hooks, E. N. (2015). Lived experi-

ences of parents of gifted students with Autism Spectrum Disorder: The struggle to find 
appropriate educational experiences. Gifted Child Quarterly, 59, 283–298. https://doi.
org/10.1177/0016986215592193

Sayler, M. F. (2015). Texas Academy of Mathematics and Science: 25 years of early college 
STEM opportunities. Roeper Review, 37, 29–38. https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2015.
975773

https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2014.976324
https://doi.org/10.1177/0162353212451703
https://doi.org/10.1177/0162353212451703
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986210369256
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986210369256
https://doi.org/10.1177/0162353218781745
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986209334962
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986209334962
https://www.nagc.org/resources-publications/gifted-education-practices/acceleration
https://www.nagc.org/resources-publications/gifted-education-practices/acceleration
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986208319976
https://doi.org/10.1037/a0029481
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf
https://robinsoncenter.uw.edu/research/
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986215592193
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986215592193
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2015.975773
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783193.2015.975773


Hertzog et al.	 35

Siegle, D., Wilson, H. E., & Little, C. A. (2013). A sample of gifted and talented educators’ 
attitudes about academic acceleration. Journal of Advanced Academics, 24, 27–51. https://
doi.org/10.1177/1932202X12472491

Southern, W. T., & Jones, E. D. (2004). Types of acceleration: Dimensions and issues. In N. 
Colangelo, S. G. Assouline, & M. U. M. Gross (Eds.), A nation deceived: How schools hold 
back America’s brightest students (pp. 5–12). https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.
pdf

Steenbergen-Hu, S., Makel, M. C., & Olszewski-Kubilius, P. (2016). What one hundred years of 
research says about the effects of ability grouping and acceleration on K–12 students’ aca-
demic achievement: Findings of two second-order meta-analyses. Review of Educational 
Research, 86, 849–899. https://doi.org/10.3102/0034654316675417

Steenbergen-Hu, S., & Moon, S. M. (2011). The effects of acceleration on high-abil-
ity learners: A meta-analysis. Gifted Child Quarterly, 55, 39–53. https://doi.
org/10.1177/0016986210383155

U.S. Department of Health and Human Services, Office of Adolescent Health. (2018). Adolescent 
development explained. https://www.hhs.gov/ash/oah/adolescent-development/explained/

Vialle, W., Ashton, T., Carlon, G., & Rankin, F. (2001). Acceleration: A coat of many colours. 
Roeper Review, 21, 14–19. https://doi.org/10.1080/02783190109554119

Wai, J. (2015). Long-term effects of educational acceleration. In S. G. Assouline, N. Colangelo, 
J. VanTassel-Baska, & A. Lupkowski-Shoplik (Eds.), A nation empowered: Evidence 
trumps the excuses holding back America’s brightest students (pp. 1–13). https://www.
researchgate.net/publication/277403890_Long-term_effects_of_educational_acceleration/
download

Wai, J., Lubinski, D., Benbow, C. P., & Steiger, J. H. (2010). Accomplishment in Science, 
Technology, Engineering, and Mathematics (STEM) and its relation to STEM educational 
dose: A 25-year longitudinal study. Journal of Educational Psychology, 102, 860–871. 
https://doi.org/10.1037/a0019454

Wells, R., Lohman, D., & Marron, M. (2009). What factors are associated with grade accel-
eration? Journal of Advanced Academics, 20, 248–273. https://doi.org/10.1177/19322
02X0902000203

Wood, S., Portman, T. A. A., Cigrand, D. L., & Colangelo, N. (2010). School counselors’ 
perceptions and experience with acceleration as a program option for gifted and talented 
students. Gifted Child Quarterly, 54, 168–178. https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986210367940

Wu, E. H. (2008). Parental influence on children’s talent development: A case study with three 
Chinese American families. Journal for the Education of the Gifted, 32, 100–129.

Young, M. H., & Balli, S. J. (2014). Gifted and Talented Education (GATE): Student and parent 
perspectives. Gifted Child Today, 37, 236–246. https://doi.org/10.1177/1076217514544030

About the Authors

Nancy B. Hertzog, PhD, is professor in the area of Learning Sciences and Human Development 
and former Director of the Robinson Center for Young Scholars at the University of Washington. 
She received her master’s degree in gifted education from the University of Connecticut, and 
her PhD in special education from the University of Illinois. In addition to studying the out-
comes of Robinson Center alumni, her research focuses on teaching strategies designed to dif-
ferentiate instruction and challenge children with diverse abilities. Specifically, she has studied 
teachers’ implementation of the Project Approach in classrooms with both high-achieving and 
low-achieving children. From 1995 to 2010, she was on the faculty in the Department of Special 

https://doi.org/10.1177/1932202X12472491
https://doi.org/10.1177/1932202X12472491
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED535138.pdf
https://doi.org/10.3102/0034654316675417
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986210383155
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986210383155
https://www.hhs.gov/ash/oah/adolescent-development/explained/
https://doi.org/10.1080/02783190109554119
https://www.researchgate.net/publication/277403890_Long-term_effects_of_educational_acceleration/download
https://www.researchgate.net/publication/277403890_Long-term_effects_of_educational_acceleration/download
https://www.researchgate.net/publication/277403890_Long-term_effects_of_educational_acceleration/download
https://doi.org/10.1037/a0019454
https://doi.org/10.1177/1932202X0902000203
https://doi.org/10.1177/1932202X0902000203
https://doi.org/10.1177/0016986210367940
https://doi.org/10.1177/1076217514544030


36	 Journal of Advanced Academics 00(0)

Education and directed University Primary School, an early childhood gifted program, at the 
University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign. She has published three books and several chapters 
on early childhood gifted education, and numerous articles in gifted education.

Kristen N. Lamb, PhD, is post-doctoral research associate for the Robinson Center at the 
University of Washington. She earned her doctorate in Educational Psychology with an empha-
sis in gifted education and creativity from the University of North Texas and previously served 
her community as a K-12 public educator. She studies equity issues in advanced and accelerated 
academics, the role of creativity in talent development of high ability students, and classroom 
conditions conducive to developing creative thinking and advanced academic achievement.  
Dr. Lamb is the co-author of Developing Creativity in the Classroom: Learning and Innovation 
for 21st-Century Schools (Kettler, Lamb, & Mullet, 2019), and she has published a number of 
articles and invited book chapters on the topics of creativity and equity in gifted education. She 
is currently an associate editor for the Journal for the Education of the Gifted.

Sakhavat Mammadov, PhD, is an assistant professor in the Department of Curriculum, 
Leadership, & Technology at Valdosta State University (VSU). He worked as a postdoctoral 
research associate for the University of Washington’s (UW) Halbert and Nancy Robinson 
Center for Young Scholars prior to his appointment at VSU. His research interests include social 
and emotional experiences of gifted students, motivation, personality, and creativity.


